B1D2020-50 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE FOR THE CITY OF TRENTON, DEPARTMENT OF WATER AND

SEWER, DIVISION OF WATER FILTRATION PLANT BID OPENING 7/29/2020 AT 11:00AM

BID2020-50 FURNISH AND
DELIVERY OF POTASSIUM
PERMANGANATE FOR THE CITY OF
TRENTON, DEPARTMENT OF WATER
AND SEWER, DIVISION OF WATER
FILTRATION PLANT

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS: 4
SHANNON
NAME OF BIDDER CHEMICAL C(I;iEE(I\)AT(C;:LSC%)OYIIT(E: BRENNTA?L'éORTHEAST UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA,
CORPORATION v i INC.
ADDRESS P.O.BOX 376 3015 STATE ROAD 81 W. HULLER LANE 200 DEAN SIEVERS PLACE
MALVERN, PA
CITY, STATE, ZIP 19355 CROYDON, PA 19021 READING, PA 19605 MORRISVILLE, PA 19067

CAROLYN MAIR-

CONTACT NAME DANIEL C. FLYNN BASUIRA KIRSTEN O'DONNELL VICTORIA MEAKIM

TELEPHONE 610-363-9090 215-785-3000 484-818-1687 215-337-5403

FAX 610-524-6050 215-785-1585 N/A 215-337-6290

E-MAIL DCFLTNN@SHANNO | BIDADMINSTRATION@C | KODONNELL@BRENNTA | VICTORIA.MEAKIM@UNIVAR
- NCHEM.COM OYNECHEMICAL.COM GE.COM SOLUTIONS.COM

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP

DISCLOSURE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

MANDATORY EQUAL

EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

LANGUAGE EXHIBIT A

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTED

ACTIVITIES IN IRAN INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES

ACT OF 1990 LANGUAGE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

DEBARMENT NOTICE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT

OF ADDENDA N/A N/A N/A N/A

REQUIRED EVIDENCE AFFIRMATIVE

ACTION REGULATION INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

ETHICS COMPLAINT DISCLOSURE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

NON-COLLUSION AFFADAVIT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS

REGISTRATION CERTIFICATION INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

FROM CONTRACTOR

EIC FROM CONTRACTOR

CERT.#11490 EXP.
07/15/2027

CERT.#5742 EXP.
10/15/2021

CERT.#555 EXP.
08/15/2021

CERT.#28919 EXP.
08/15/2020

CITY OF TRENTON RESIDENT
EMPLOYMENT POLICY

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

REQUIRED FROM

REQUIRED FROM

REQUIRED FROM

REQUIRED FROM

AWARDED VENDOR| AWARDED VENDOR AWARDED VENDOR AWARDED VENDOR
THREE (3) REFERENCES INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
60-DAY EXTENSION COMPLIANCE YES YES YES YES
COMPLIANCE WITH EMERGENCY
SERVICES YES YES YES YES
W-9 INCLUDED N/A N/A INCLUDED
$507.21
$548.1681 MINIMUM

MANUFACTURER: $805.20 FOR 330LB
UNIT PRICE PER DRUM ORGANIC '|6[I))Elilll\ll\/;$ER DRUMS @2.44/LB $844.05/DRUM

INDUSTRIES, INDIA
TOTAL BID PRICE $202,884.00 $219.267.24 $322,080.00 $337.620.00
OPTION TO EXTEND

$527.21
$554.5993 MINIMUM

MANUFACTURER: $805.20 FOR 330LB
UNIT PRICE PER DRUM ORGANIC '|6[I))Elilll\ll\/;$ER DRUMS @2.44/LB NO BID

INDUSTRIES, INDIA
TOTAL BID PRICE $210,884.00 $221,839.72 $322,080.00 NO BID
EXCEPTIONS (IF ANY) NONE NONE NONE NONE
FATAL FLAW NONE NONE NONE NONE
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PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
FY 2021

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water
Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnQs as per the attached
specifications.

r Quantity | Description Unit Price Total Bid Price
_ B Per drum
KMnOj4 per attached
400 drums specifications |
| | g 507.21 | §202,884.00

Manufacturer: Organic Industries, India

Daniel C. Flynn
Respectfully Submitted

D))=

(Signature)

Shannon Chemical Co;porqE;on
(Company)

Daniel C. Flynn

Person to Contact:

Telephone Number:  ©10- 363-9090

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

FY 2021 Potassium Permanganate 7/2/20 TBH 4



PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
FY 2022

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water
Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnQO4 as per the attached
specifications.

Quantity Description | UnitPrice | Total Bid Price
Per drum ‘
' KMnOs per attached |
400 drums ‘ specifications ‘ |
|$527.21 $ 210,884.00 |

Manufacturer: Organic Industries, India

Daniel C. Flynn
Respectfully Submitted

D¢~

(Sigﬁature)

_Shannon Chemical Corporation
(Company)

Person to Contact: Daniel C. Flynn

Telephone Number: 610-363-9090

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

FY 2021 Potassium Permanganate 7/2/20 TBH 5



PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
FY 2021

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water
Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnO4 as per the attached
specifications.

i Quantity | Description . Unit Price Total Bid Price
| | | Per drum I B
KMnOq4 per attached '
400 drums | specifications
| | $548.1681 $219,267.24

Minimum 16 drums per delivery

Donald C. Helwig, Vice-President/CFO
Respectfully Submitted

George S. Coyne Chemical Co, Inc.
(Company)

Person to Contact: Carolyn Mair-Basiura, Bid Admin Mgr.

Telephone Number: _215-785-3000

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.
3015 State Road
Croydon, PA 19021-6997
Phone: 215-785-3000 Fax: 215-785-1585

FY 2021 Potassium Permanganate 7/2/20 TBH 4



PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
FY 2022

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water
Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnOs as per the attached
specifications.

Quantity Description Unit Price Total Bid Price
L . - Per drum -
| KMnO; per attached ‘

400 drums specifications
L - $554.5993 $221,839.72

Minimum 16 drums per delivery

Donald C. Helwig, Vice-President/CFO

Respectfully Submitted

George S. Coyne Chemical Co, Inc.
(Company)

Person to Contact: Carolyn Mair-Basiura, Bid Admin Mgr.

Telephone Number: 215-785-3000 .

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

George S, Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.
3015 State Road
Croydon, PA 19021-6997
Phone: 215-785-3000 Fax: 215.785-1585

FY 2021 Potassium Permanganate 7/2/20 TBH 5



PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassinm Permanganate
FY 2021

The undersigned proposes to fumnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water
Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnOx as per the attached
specifications.

Quantity | Description Unit Price Total Bid Price ‘
| . Per drum :

KMnO; per attached

pera |
400 drums ‘ specifications 5 8 06 20 : ; 322 (Bo‘l
320lbdrums 0 2.44 [l

-%cc@m Kirsten O Donnell

Respectfully Submitted

@mﬁqw
hmﬁ%%ﬂm%& LLO

Person to Contact: M\ \
relephons Neamber: TOH-818 11,87

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

FY 2021 Potassium Permanganate 7/2/20 TBH 4



PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
FY 2022

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water
Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnO4 as per the attached
specifications.

Quantity | Description | Unit Price { Total Bid Price |
| ' Per drum

| KMnOq per attached

Hodome | wesfeier [5805.20 15322 080
220Todrums & 2 44 I
Kirsten O

Respectfully Submitted

QQ
(Signature)

Person to Contact: |

Telephone Number: L‘BL\' %% "“Dg',

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

FY 2021 Potassium Permanganate 7/2/20 TBH 5



PROPOSAL @

TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
FY 2021

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water
Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnQy4 as per the aitached

specifications.

Quantity Description ' Unit Price . Total Bid Price
; ! Perdrum S
KMnOQj per attached
400 drumns specifications

$ 844.05/[Drum  § 337,620.00

Victoria Meakim
Respectfully Submitted

V4 (Signature)

Univar Solutions USA Inc.
(Company)

Person to Contact: Victoria Meakim for bids victoria.meakim@univarsolutions.com
Customer Service for orders custsvc-morris@univarusa.com
Jimmy Tedesco Account Manager jimmy.tedesco@univarsolutions.com

Telephone Number: 215-337-5403 Victoria Meakim Customer Service for orders (877) 561-6990

Jimmy Tedesco Account Manager 732-215-6331
PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

FY 2021 Potassium Permanganate 7/2/20 TBH 4



PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
FY 2022

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water
Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnO4 as per the attached
specifications.

 Quantity Description Unit Price Total Bid Price
- | - Per drum -
KMnO; per attached
400 drums specifications
% NO BID | $ NOBID
NO BID )
Respectfully Submitted
NO BID
(Signature)
NOBID .
(Company)

Person to Contact: NO BID

Telephone Number: ~ NO BID
PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

FY 2021 Potassium Permanganate 7/2/20 TBH 5



