

**BID2021-07 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR FOR THE CITY OF TRENTON EMPLOYEES
BID OPENED 2/11/2021 AT 11:00AM**

BID2021-07 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR FOR THE CITY OF TRENTON EMPLOYEES		
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS:	2	
NAME OF BIDDER	CONCEPT PRINTING, INC.	THE LIBERTY STORE, INC.
ADDRESS	40 LYDEDLER STREET	5 EAST GENESA STREET
CITY, STATE, ZIP	NYACK, NY 10960	AUBURN, NY 13021
CONTACT NAME	JORDAN CAMPOS	MARTY GOLDMAN
TELEPHONE	845-353-9080	315-252-1767
FAX	845-353-3030	312-282-2400
E-MAIL	JORDAN@CONCEPTPRINT.COM	MARTY@THELIBERTYSTORE.COM
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
REQUIRED EVIDENCE EEO/AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATIONS QUESTIONNAIRE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE EXHIBIT A	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA	N/A	N/A
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE	REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR WITH SIGNED CONTRACTS	INCLUDED
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT OF 1990 LANGUAGE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTED ACTIVITIES IN IRAN	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
DEBARMENT NOTICE (REQUIRED)	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
ETHICS COMPLAINT DISCLOSURE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
CITY OF TRENTON RESIDENT EMPLOYMENT POLICY	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
EIC	CERT.#19105 EXP. 05/15/2023	CERT.#28249 EXP. 04/15/2021
60-DAY EXTENSION COMPLIANCE	YES	YES
COMPLIANCE WITH EMERGENCY SERVICES	NO	YES
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE	REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR WITH SIGNED CONTRACTS	REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR WITH SIGNED CONTRACTS
REFERENCES	N/A	INCLUDED
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEMS#1-75	SEE ATTACHED BREAKDOWN OF PRICING PER ITEM	SEE ATTACHED BREAKDOWN OF PRICING
EXCEPTIONS (IF ANY)	YES SEE ATTACHED	YE SEE ATTACHED
FATAL FLAW	NONE	NONE

Concept Print

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR ONE

18	110	RED KAP #SC10 100% COTTON LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE)	No Bid
19	110	RED KAP #SC40 100% COTTON SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE)	25.34
20	150	GILDAN #2300 OR EQUIVALENT 100% COTTON TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" ORANGE)	10.00
21	950	CITY OF TRENTON SEWN ON PATCHES	1.64
22	150	EMBROIDERIES OVER RIGHT POCKET IN RED "WATER METER READER"	1.74
23	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE TROUSERS SPRUCE GREEN UP TO SIZE 44/RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE)	No Bid
24	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE)	m-xl 54.79 2xl-3xl 63.19
25	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT - (PW SOLID WASTE)+C7	m-xl 57.29 2xl-4xl 65.69
26	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE)	m-xl 57.29 2xl-4xl 65.69
27	142	SAFETY REFLECTIVE MID-LENGTH JACKET SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP# OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	s-xl 101.93 2x-4x 121.93
28	142	SAFETY REFLECTIVE IKE JACKET SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	44-50 111.83 52-58 134.19
29	142	SAFETY REFLECTIVE B340 WINTER COATS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	103.64
30	142	SAFETY REFLECTIVE INSULATED COVERALLS FOR WINTER BROWN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT-(PW-SOLID WASTE)	36-50 38.79 52-54 46.54
		DESCRIPTION	YEAR ONE UNIT COST PER ITEM
31		SHIRTS SIZE 18-18 1/2 + WILL BE	NO Bid
		% DISCOUNT CHARGES ON OVER SIZE	
		\$ OF UNIT COST	

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
 QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
 BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR ONE

32	PANTS SIZE 44+ WILL BE	_____ \$ OF UNIT COST	No Bid
33	TEE SHIRTS SIZE XXL + WILL BE	_____ \$ OF UNIT COST	No Bid
	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	YEAR ONE UNIT COST PER ITEM
34	JACKETS, COATS, COVERALLS 2 x + WILL BE	_____ \$ OF UNIT COST	No Bid
	ESTIMATED QUANTITIES	FOOTWEAR DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST PER ITEM
35	450	WOLVERINE STEEL TOE WATERPROOF BOOT STYLE 6" STYLE #2350 IN BLACK _____	116.70
36	150	WOLVERINE STEEL TOE LOE STYLE #3106 IN BLACK +C61	No Bid 111.30
37	150	WOLVERINE NON-STEEL TOE 6" STYLE #2352 IN BLACK _____	No Bid
38	5	WOLVERINE NON-STEEL TOE LOW STYLE #3108 IN BLACK _____	No Bid
39	5	BATES WATERPROOF HIKER NON-STEEL WOMEN'S BOOT SLIP RESISTANT STYLE #2766 IN BLACK _____	202.43
40	5	NAUTILUS NON-STEEL WOMEN'S SHOE #5077 IN BLACK _____	115.00

Concept Print

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR ONE

	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	YEAR ONE UNIT COST PER ITEM
1	350	DICKIES #874 OR EQUIVALENT SPRUCE GREEN TROUSERS UP TO SIZE 44 _____	\$24.50
2	150	RED KAP PT20 OR EQUIVALENT SPRUCE GREEN TROUSERS SIZE 46 AND UP _____	28.10
3	250	DICKIES #874N OR EQUIVALENT NAVY BLUE TROUSERS _____	24.50
4	250	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT LEEVE SPRUCE GREEN SHIRTS _____	23.20
5	250	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT SLEEVE NAVY BLUE SHIRTS _____	23.20
6	150	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT SLEEVE LIGHT BLUE SHIRTS _____	23.20
7	450	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE SPRUCE GREEN SHIRTS _____	23.70
8	150	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE LIGHT BLUE SHIRTS _____	23.70
9	150	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVLANET LONG SLEEVE NAVY BLUE SHIRTS _____	23.70
10	70	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVLANET LONG SLEEVE WHITE SHIRTS _____	23.70
11	850	JERZEES #29MP OR EQUIVALENT TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" ORANGE) _____	7.60
12	850	JERZEES #29MP OR EQUIVALENT TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" LIME GREEN) _____	7.60
13	350	RED KAP #JT50 MID-LENGTH JACKETS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	63.30
14	350	RED KAP #JT22 IKE JACKET OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	61.40
15	150	B340 WINTER COATS (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	No Bid
16	150	RED KAP #CT30 INSULATED COVERALLS FOR WINTER (IN BROWN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	92.50
17	110	RED KAP #PC10 100% COTTON TROUSERS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	No Bid

**PROPOSAL PAGES FOR UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR ARE ATTACHED.
IF VENDOR IS BIDDING EQUIVALENT ITEMS, THEY MUST DESCRIBE THE
EQUIVALENT ITEMS ON THE EXCEPTION PAGE.**

Concept Print

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
 QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
 OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO
 BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR TWO

	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO UNIT COST PER ITEM
1	350	DICKIES #874 OR EQUIVALENT SPRUCE GREEN TROUSERS UP TO SIZE 44 _____	Same ↓
2	150	RED KAP PT20 OR EQUIVALENT SPRUCE GREEN TROUSERS SIZE 46 AND UP _____	
3	250	DICKIES #874N OR EQUIVALENT NAVY BLUE TROUSERS _____	
4	250	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT LEEVE SPRUCE GREEN SHIRTS _____	
5	250	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT SLEEVE NAVY BLUE SHIRTS _____	
6	150	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT SLEEVE LIGHT BLUE SHIRTS _____	
7	450	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE SPRUCE GREEN SHIRTS _____	
8	150	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE LIGHT BLUE SHIRTS _____	
9	150	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVLANET LONG SLEEVE NAVY BLUE SHIRTS _____	
10	70	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVLANET LONG SLEEVE WHITE SHIRTS _____	
11	850	JERZEES #29MP OR EQUIVALENT TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" ORANGE) _____	
12	850	JERZEES #29MP OR EQUIVALENT TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" LIME GREEN) _____	
13	350	RED KAP #JT50 MID-LENGTH JACKETS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	
14	350	RED KAP #JT22 IKE JACKET OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	
15	150	B340 WINTER COATS (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	
16	150	RED KAP #CT30 INSULATED COVERALLS FOR WINTER (IN BROWN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	
17	110	RED KAP #PC10 100% COTTON TROUSERS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	

Concept Print

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
 QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
 OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO
 BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR TWO

18	110	RED KAP #SC10 100% COTTON LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE)	
19	110	RED KAP #SC40 100% COTTON SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE)	
20	150	GILDAN #2300 OR EQUIVALENT 100% COTTON TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" ORANGE)	
21	950	CITY OF TRENTON SEWN ON PATCHES	
22	150	EMBROIDERIES OVER RIGHT POCKET IN RED "WATER METER READER"	
23	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE TROUSERS SPRUCE GREEN UP TO SIZE 44/RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOILD WASTE)	
24	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE)	
25	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT - (PW SOLID WASTE)+C7	
26	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE)	
27	142	SAFETY REFLECTIVE MID-LENGTH JACKET SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP# OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	
28	142	SAFETY REFLECTIVE IKE JACKET SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	
29	142	SAFETY REFLECTIVE B340 WINTER COATS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	
30	142	SAFETY REFLECTIVE INSULATED COVERALLS FOR WINTER BROWN RED KAP # OR EQUIVALENT-(PW-SOLID WASTE)	
	DESCRIPTION	% DISCOUNT CHARGES ON OVER SIZE	OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO UNIT COST PER ITEM
31	SHIRTS SIZE 18-18 1/2 + WILL BE	\$ OF UNIT COST	

Concept Print

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
 QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
 OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO
 BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR TWO

32	PANTS SIZE 44+ WILL BE	_____ \$ OF UNIT COST	Same
33	TEE SHIRTS SIZE XXL + WILL BE	_____ \$ OF UNIT COST	↓
	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO UNIT COST PER ITEM
34	JACKETS, COATS, COVERALLS 2 x + WILL BE	_____ \$ OF UNIT COST	
	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	FOOTWEAR DESCRIPTION	OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO UNIT COST PER ITEM
35	450	WOLVERINE STEEL TOE WATERPROOF BOOT STYLE 6" STYLE #2350 IN BLACK _____	
36	150	WOLVERINE STEEL TOE LOE STYLE #3106 IN BLACK +C61	
37	150	WOLVERINE NON-STEEL TOE 6" STYLE #2352 IN BLACK _____	
38	5	WOLVERINE NON-STEEL TOE LOW STYLE #3108 IN BLACK _____	
39	5	BATES WATERPROOF HIKER NON-STEEL WOMEN'S BOOT SLIP RESISTANT STYLE #2766 IN BLACK _____	
40	5	NAUTILUS NON-STEEL WOMEN'S SHOE #5077 IN BLACK _____	

**EXCEPTIONS
(IF NONE, PLEASE NOTE)**

Some model # have changed

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR ONE

	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	YEAR ONE UNIT COST PER ITEM
1	350	DICKIES #874 OR EQUIVALENT SPRUCE GREEN TROUSERS UP TO SIZE 44 <u>Dickies 874</u>	\$ 20.25
2	150	RED KAP PT20 OR EQUIVALENT SPRUCE GREEN TROUSERS SIZE 46 AND UP <u>PT20</u>	\$ 18.30
3	250	DICKIES #874N OR EQUIVALENT NAVY BLUE TROUSERS <u>Dickies 874</u>	\$ 20.25
4	250	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT SLEEVE SPRUCE GREEN SHIRTS <u>Dickies 1574</u>	\$ 17.89
5	250	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT SLEEVE NAVY BLUE SHIRTS <u>Dickies 1574</u>	\$ 17.89
6	150	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT SLEEVE LIGHT BLUE SHIRTS <u>Dickies 1574</u>	\$ 17.89
7	450	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE SPRUCE GREEN SHIRTS <u>Dickies 574</u>	\$ 19.58
8	150	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE LIGHT BLUE SHIRTS <u>Dickies #574</u>	\$ 19.58
9	150	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE NAVY BLUE SHIRTS <u>Dickies #574</u>	\$ 19.58
10	70	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE WHITE SHIRTS <u>Dickies 574</u>	\$ 19.58
11	850	JERZEES #29MP OR EQUIVALENT TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" ORANGE) <u>Jerzee 29mp</u>	\$ 6.02
12	850	JERZEES #29MP OR EQUIVALENT TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" LIME GREEN) <u>Jerzee 29mp</u>	\$ 6.02
13	350	RED KAP #JT50 MID-LENGTH JACKETS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) <u>JT50</u>	\$ 31.86
14	350	RED KAP #JT22 IKE JACKET OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) <u>JT22</u>	\$ 29.84
15	150	<u>Discontinued</u> B340 WINTER COATS (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) <u>Alpha #88205</u>	\$ 67.50
16	150	RED KAP #CT30 INSULATED COVERALLS FOR WINTER (IN BROWN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) <u>Navy only</u>	\$ 62.00
17	110	RED KAP #PC10 100% COTTON TROUSERS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) <u>Now #PC20</u>	\$ 21.78

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR ONE

18	110	RED KAP #SC10 100% COTTON LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) <u>Now SC30</u>	\$ 17.69
19	110	RED KAP #SC40 100% COTTON SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE)	\$ 17.29
20	150	GILDAN #2300 OR EQUIVALENT 100% COTTON TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" ORANGE) <u>see note 7</u>	\$ 6.93
21	950	CITY OF TRENTON SEWN ON PATCHES	\$ 1.60
22	150	EMBROIDERIES OVER RIGHT POCKET IN RED "WATER METER READER"	2.00
23	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE TROUSERS SPRUCE GREEN UP TO SIZE 44/RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE) <u>PT20 YV EH5281 D30</u>	53.73
24	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # <u>SP24</u> OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE)	42.50
25	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # <u>SP14</u> OR EQUIVALENT - (PW SOLID WASTE)+C7?	46.50
26	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # <u>SP14</u> OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE)	46.50
27	142	<u>YV EH5281 D93</u> SAFETY REFLECTIVE MID-LENGTH JACKET SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # <u>JT50</u> OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	69.90
28	142	<u>YV EH5281 D93</u> SAFETY REFLECTIVE IKE JACKET SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # <u>JT22</u> OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	67.90
29	142	<u>Alpha # 88205 + sew on Refl.</u> SAFETY REFLECTIVE B340 WINTER COATS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	84.50
30	142	SAFETY REFLECTIVE INSULATED COVERALLS FOR WINTER BROWN RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT-(PW-SOLID WASTE) <u>CT30 YV EH5281 D36</u>	110.40
DESCRIPTION		% DISCOUNT CHARGES ON OVER SIZE	YEAR ONE UNIT COST PER ITEM
31	SHIRTS SIZE 18-18 1/2 + WILL BE	<u>add 30%</u> OF UNIT COST	<u>add 30%</u>

note:
orange is
100% cotton
+ safety
orange is
50/50

on Reflective add 1890

2021

Liberty Store

(2021)

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
 QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
 BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR ONE

32	PANTS SIZE 44+ WILL BE	30% \$ OF UNIT COST	add 30% to cost Reflective add 18%
33	TEE SHIRTS SIZE XXL + WILL BE	30% \$ OF UNIT COST	add 30% to cost
	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	YEAR ONE UNIT COST PER ITEM
34	JACKETS, COATS, COVERALLS 2 x + WILL BE	30% \$ OF UNIT COST	add 30% to cost Reflective add 18%
	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	FOOTWEAR DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST PER ITEM
35	450	WOLVERINE STEEL TOE WATERPROOF BOOT STYLE 6" STYLE #2350 IN BLACK 10694	74.10
36	150	Nautilus #7119 (Avenger) WOLVERINE STEEL TOE LOE STYLE #3106 IN BLACK +C61 composite toe	72.10
37	150	WOLVERINE NON-STEEL TOE 6" STYLE #2352 IN BLACK 10691	72.10
38	5	WOLVERINE NON-STEEL TOE LOW STYLE #3108 IN BLACK Bates #E22233	72.10
39	5	BATES WATERPROOF HIKER NON-STEEL WOMEN'S BOOT SLIP RESISTANT STYLE #2766 IN BLACK Bates 2766	107.00
40	5	NAUTILUS NON-STEEL WOMEN'S SHOE #5077 IN BLACK 5062	79.50

(2022)

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
 QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
 OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO
 BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR TWO

	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO UNIT COST PER ITEM
1	350	DICKIES #874 OR EQUIVALENT SPRUCE GREEN TROUSERS UP TO SIZE 44 _____	21.26
2	150	RED KAP PT20 OR EQUIVALENT SPRUCE GREEN TROUSERS SIZE 46 AND UP _____	19.22
3	250	DICKIES #874N OR EQUIVALENT NAVY BLUE TROUSERS _____	21.26
4	250	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT LEEVE SPRUCE GREEN SHIRTS _____	18.78
5	250	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT SLEEVE NAVY BLUE SHIRTS _____	18.78
6	150	DICKIES #1574 OR EQUIVALENT SHORT SLEEVE LIGHT BLUE SHIRTS _____	18.78
7	450	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE SPRUCE GREEN SHIRTS _____	20.55
8	150	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVALENT LONG SLEEVE LIGHT BLUE SHIRTS _____	20.55
9	150	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVLANET LONG SLEEVE NAVY BLUE SHIRTS _____	20.55
10	70	DICKIES #574 OR EQUIVLANET LONG SLEEVE WHITE SHIRTS _____	20.55
11	850	JERZEES #29MP OR EQUIVALENT TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" ORANGE) _____	6.32
12	850	JERZEES #29MP OR EQUIVALENT TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" LIME GREEN) _____	6.32
13	350	RED KAP #JT50 MID-LENGTH JACKETS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	33.45
14	350	RED KAP #JT22 IKE JACKET OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	31.33
15	150	B340 WINTER COATS (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) <u>Alpha 88205</u>	70.88
16	150	RED KAP #CT30 INSULATED COVERALLS FOR WINTER (IN BROWN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) _____	65.10
17	110	RED KAP #PC10 100% COTTON TROUSERS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) <u>PC20</u>	22.87

(2022)

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
 QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
 OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO
 BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR TWO

18	110	RED KAP #SC10 100% COTTON LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE) <u>SC30</u>	18.57
19	110	RED KAP #SC40 100% COTTON SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS OR EQUIVALENT (IN SPRUCE GREEN AND/OR NAVY BLUE)	18.15
20	150	GILDAN #2300 OR EQUIVALENT 100% COTTON TEE SHIRTS W/POCKET (IN "SAFETY" ORANGE) <u>orange</u>	7.28
21	950	CITY OF TRENTON SEWN ON PATCHES	1.60
22	150	EMBROIDERIES OVER RIGHT POCKET IN RED "WATER METER READER"	2.00
23	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE TROUSERS SPRUCE GREEN UP TO SIZE 44/RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE) <u>PT20 YV EH5281 D30</u>	56.42
24	188	<u>SP24 YV EH5281</u> SAFETY REFLECTIVE SHORT SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE)	44.63
25	188	SAFETY REFLECTIVE LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT - (PW SOLID WASTE)+C7 <u>SP14 YV EH5281</u>	48.83
26	188	<u>SP14 YV EH5281</u> SAFETY REFLECTIVE LONG SLEEVE SHIRTS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT- (PW SOLID WASTE)	48.83
27	142	<u>JT50 YV EH5281 D93</u> SAFETY REFLECTIVE MID-LENGTH JACKET SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP# _____ OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	73.40
28	142	<u>JT22 YV EH5281 D93</u> SAFETY REFLECTIVE IJE JACKET SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	71.30
29	142	<u>Alpha 88 205 + sew on Ref.</u> SAFETY REFLECTIVE B340 WINTER COATS SPRUCE GREEN RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT (PW-SOLID WASTE)	88.72
30	142	<u>CT30 YV EH5281 D36</u> SAFETY REFLECTIVE INSULATED COVERALLS FOR WINTER BROWN RED KAP # _____ OR EQUIVALENT-(PW-SOLID WASTE)	115.92
	DESCRIPTION	% DISCOUNT CHARGES ON OVER SIZE	OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO UNIT COST PER ITEM
31	SHIRTS SIZE 18-18 1/2 + WILL BE	____ \$ OF UNIT COST	add 30% Reflective add 18% clothing

UNIFORMS AND FOOTWEAR PROPOSAL PAGE
 QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED. THE CITY OF TRENTON HAS THE RIGHT TO INCREASE OR DECREASE QUANTITIES AS NEEDED
 OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO
 BIDDER MUST INSERT UNIT PRICE FOR YEAR TWO

32	PANTS SIZE 44+ WILL BE	____ \$ OF UNIT COST	add 30% Reflective add 18%
33	TEE SHIRTS SIZE XXL + WILL BE	____ \$ OF UNIT COST	add 30% Reflective add 18%
	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO UNIT COST PER ITEM
34	JACKETS, COATS, COVERALLS 2 x + WILL BE	____ \$ OF UNIT COST	add 30% Reflective add 18%
	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	FOOTWEAR DESCRIPTION	OPTION TO EXTEND YEAR TWO UNIT COST PER ITEM
35	450	WOLVERINE STEEL TOE WATERPROOF BOOT STYLE 6" STYLE #2350 IN BLACK <u>10694</u>	77.80
36	150	<u>Avenger # 7119</u> WOLVERINE STEEL TOE LOE STYLE #3106 IN BLACK +C61	75.70
37	150	WOLVERINE NON-STEEL TOE 6" STYLE #2352 IN BLACK <u>10691</u>	75.70
38	5	WOLVERINE NON-STEEL TOE LOW STYLE #3108 IN BLACK <u>Bates E22233</u>	75.70
39	5	BATES WATERPROOF HIKER NON-STEEL WOMEN'S BOOT SLIP RESISTANT STYLE #2766 IN BLACK <u>Bates 2766</u>	112.00
40	5	NAUTILUS NON-STEEL WOMEN'S SHOE #5077 IN BLACK <u>5062</u>	83.48

EXCEPTIONS
(IF NONE, PLEASE NOTE)

Coat B340 is Alpha # 88205

PC10 pant is PC20

SC10 shirt is SC30

Gildan #2300 100% cotton is orange, safety orange is sfo

Boots

Wolverine #2300 discontinued - Wolverine #10694

Wolverine #3106 discontinued - Avenger #7115

Wolverine #2352 discontinued, Wolverine #10691

Wolverine #3108 discontinued, Bates #E22283

Nautilus #5077 discontinued Nautilus #5062

THE LIBERTY STORE

"COMPLETE OUTFITTERS FOR MEN SINCE 1917"

5 E. Genesee Street, Auburn, New York 13021

Phone (315) 252-1761 • Fax (315) 282-2400

Email: marty@thelibertystore.com

2/5/21

City of
Trenton

Bid 2021-07

uniform

Exceptions info & specs

Coat B340 - discontinued - Alpha #88205 - I have
been supplying this in 2020
- specs included

PC10 pant - just a number change to PC20 - about 2yrs
supplying this

SC10 shirt is just a " to SC30 " pant

Gildan 2300 100% cotton has always been "orange".
all safety colors are 50/50 to meet safety specs.

Boots

Wolverine #2300 → #10694 > specs included

Wolverine #2352 → #10691

Wolverine #3106 → Avenger 7119 - specs included

Wolverine #3108 → Bates #E22233 - this shoe has been
supplied in 2019 &
2020
specs included

Nautilus #5077 → 5062 - specs included

Thank you Wendy Goldman



9546 | BROWN

M & W: 6-11, 12, 13, 14

Mark II Slip Rating: .33



9548 | MEN'S BROWN

M & W: 6-12, 13, 14

Mark II Slip Rating: .43



5020 | MEN'S BLACK 5060 | WOMEN'S BLACK

Men's M & W: 7-12, 13, 14

Women's M & W: 6-10, 11

Mark II Slip Rating: .41



5022 | MEN'S BLACK

5062 | WOMEN'S BLACK

Men's M & W: 7-12, 13, 14

Women's M & W: 6-10, 11

Mark II Slip Rating: .41



5024 | MEN'S BLACK

5064 | WOMEN'S BLACK

Men's M & W: 7-12, 13, 14

Women's M & W: 6-10, 11

Mark II Slip Rating: .41



5021 | MEN'S BLACK

M & W: 7-12, 13, 14

Mark II Slip Rating: .41



5023 | MEN'S BLACK

M & W: 7-12, 13, 14

Mark II Slip Rating: .41



5050 | MEN'S BLACK

5055 | WOMEN'S BLACK

Men's M & W: 7-12, 13, 14

Women's M & W: 5-10, 11

Mark II Slip Rating: .45



5075 | WOMEN'S BLACK

M & W: 5-10, 11, 12

Mark II Slip Rating: .60

COMPOSITE TOE OXFORD



7118 | MEN'S BROWN

7119 | MEN'S BLACK

7164 | WOMEN'S BROWN - LILAC

Men's M & W: 7-12, 13, 14

Women's M & W: 6-10, 11

Mark II Slip Rating: .35



COMPOSITE TOE SLIP-ON



7108 | MEN'S BROWN

7109 | MEN'S BLACK

7165 | WOMEN'S BROWN

7169 | WOMEN'S BLACK

Men's M & W: 7-12, 13, 14

Women's M & W: 6-10, 11

Mark II Slip Rating: .35

HIGH GLOSS DUTY OXFORD

WOMEN'S 22741 - PAG



E22141 - BLACK
M 7-12,13,14,15,16,17 W 7-12,13,14,15

TECHNOLOGY & FEATURES:



Lightweight slip resistant Rubberlon outsole

- Easy to clean high gloss upper
- Mesh lining for added breathability



HIGH SHINE DUTY OXFORD



E22233 - BLACK
M 4-12,13,14,15,16,17 W 7-12,13,14,15

TECHNOLOGY & FEATURES:



Bates DuraShocks® shock absorbing comfort technology



Lightweight, slip resistant Rubberlon outsole

- High shine leather upper
- Mesh lining for added breathability





WORK WEDGE BEST SELLER



6" Tan
W08289 Steel-Toe
W08288 Soft-Toe

TOE TYPE: Steel-Toe or Soft-Toe
UPPER: Full-Grain leather
LINING: Unlined
INSULATED: N/A
FOOTBED: Removable Full-Cushion
MIDSOLE: N/A
OUTSOLE: PU wedge
CONSTRUCTION: Goodyear™ Welt
SHANK: Nylon
RATING: ASTM F2413-18 M I/75 C/75 EH
SIZING: M 7-12, 13, 14; EW 7-12, 13
 6-WB0517/0096, 10-WB0517
 6-WB0526, 8-WB0576/0056



OUTSOLE RESISTANCE

- ☒ OIL
- ☒ WATER
- ☒ ABRASION
- ☐ CHEMICAL
- ☐ HEAT
- ☒ SLIP



10" Tan
W08285 Soft-Toe



6" Brown
W10744 Soft-Toe



8" Brown
W10741 Steel-Toe



6" Black
W08152 Steel-Toe
W08151 Soft-Toe



6" Tan - WPF
W10840 Steel-Toe
W10841 Soft-Toe

FLOORHAND BEST SELLER



6" Dark Brown
W10633 Steel-Toe BEST SELLER
W10643 Soft-Toe

TOE TYPE: Steel-Toe or Soft-Toe
UPPER: Premium Waterproof Full-Grain Leather
LINING: Breathable Waterproof Membrane with Moisture Wicking Mesh
INSULATED: N/A
FOOTBED: Removable Full-Cushion Molded EVA
MIDSOLE: Rubber
OUTSOLE: Rubber Lug
CONSTRUCTION: BonWelt
SHANK: Nylon
RATING: ASTM F2413-18 M I/75 C/75 EH
SIZING: Men's: M 7-12, 13, 14; EW 7-12, 13
 Women's: M 5-10, 11; W 5-10
 6-WB0525/0005, 10-WB0595/W0575



**WATERPROOF
PLUS**



OUTSOLE RESISTANCE

- ☒ OIL
- ☒ WATER
- ☒ ABRASION
- ☐ CHEMICAL
- ☐ HEAT
- ☒ SLIP



6" Wheat
W10632 Steel-Toe
W10642 Soft-Toe



6" Black
W10694 Steel-Toe
W10691 Soft-Toe



10" Dark Brown
W10680 Steel-Toe
W10682 Soft-Toe



6" Dark Brown - Women's
W10696 Steel-Toe



6" Black - Women's
W201153 Steel-Toe