BID2021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF 15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE FOR THE CITY OF
TRENTON, DEPARTMENT OF WATER AND SEWER BID OPENING 12/15/2021 AT 11:00AM

BID2021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE FOR A
PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR WITH AN
OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) THE CITY
OF TRENTON, DEPARTMENT OF WATER
AND SEWER

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS:

4

NAME OF BIDDER

UNIVAR SOLUTIONS
USA, INC.

KUEHNE CHEMICAL CO.,
INC.

MIRACLE CHECMICAL
COMPANY

JCI JONES CHEMICAL INC

ADDRESS

200 DEAN SIEVERS
PLACES

86 NORTH HACKENSACK
AVENUE

1151 B. HIGHWAY, #33

1765 RINGLING BLVD

CITY, STATE, ZIP

MORRISVILLE, PA 19067

KEARNY, NJ 07032

FARMINGDALE, NJ 07727

SARASOTA, FL 34236

CONTACT NAME VICTORIA MEAKIM SUSAN K. ANTHONY ROBERT A. ALLOTTA SUMMER MELLO

TELEPHONE 267-397-4074 973-589-0700 732-938-9110 941-330-1537

FAX N/A 973-589-4866 732-938-6630 941-330-6357
VICTORIA.MEAKIM@UNIV | BIDS@KUEHNECOMPANY. | SALES@MIRACLECHEMICAL.

- SUMMER@JCICHEM.COM
E-MAIL ERSOLUTIONS.COM CoM CoM SUMMER@JCICHEM.COM
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP
DISCLOSURE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT
OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
f:z'iﬁwsu“ OF INVESTED ACTIVITIES IN INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT OF
1990 LANGUAGE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
DEBARMENT NOTICE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF
ADDENDA N/A N/A N/A N/A
REQUIRED EVIDENCE AFFIRMATIVE
ACTION REGULATION INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
ETHICS COMPLAINT DISCLOSURE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
NON-COLLUSION AFFADAVIT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION INCLUDED INCLUDED REQUIRED PRIOR TO INCLUDED

CERTIFICATION FROM CONTRACTOR

AWARD FROM VENDOR

EIC FROM CONTRACTOR

CERT.#28919 EXP.
08/15/2023

CERT.#6584 EXP.
01/15/2022

REQUIRED PRIOR TO
AWARD FROM VENDOR

CERT.#1338 EXP. 05/15/2022

CITY OF TRENTON RESIDENT
EMPLOYMENT POLICY

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

REQUIRED FROM

REQUIRED FROM

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED

AWARDED VENDOR AWARDED VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
THREE (3) REFERENCES N/A N/A N/A INCLUDED
60-DAY EXTENSION COMPLIANCE NO YES YES YES
COMPLIANCE WITH EMERGENCY
SERVICES YES YES YES YES
W-9 INCLUDED N/A INCLUDED INCLUDED
UNIT PRICE PER GALLON $1.272/GALLON $1.29/GALLON $1.419/GALLON $2.00/GALLON
TOTAL BID PRICE $381.600.00 $387.000.00 $425,700.00 $600.000.00
OPTION TO EXTEND
UNIT PRICE PER GALLON NO BID $1.35/GALLON NO BID NO BID
TOTAL BID PRICE NO BID $405,000.00 NO BID NO BID
EXCEPTIONS (IF ANY) NONE NONE NONE NONE
FATAL FLAW NONE NONE NONE NONE
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PROPOSAL
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
CALENDAR YEAR 2022
YEAR ONE

\

The undersigned proposes to fumish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and Melion

Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Quantity | Units Description Unit Price Total Bid Price
(per gallon)
300,000 Gallons 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
per the attached $ 1.272/Gal $ 381,600.00
specification

Victoria Meakim, Municipal Specialist

- Respecﬁully‘l Submitted

P
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-

(Signature)

Univar Solutions USA Inc.

(Company)

Contact Person: _Victoria Meakim

Telephone Number: _267-397-4074

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.

BID2021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF 15%SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE - WATER FILTRATION PLANT OPENING DATE:
12-15-2021 AT 11:00AM




PROPOSAL
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
CALENDAR YEAR 2023
OPTION TO EXTEND THE CONTRACT FOR ONE (1) YEAR

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and Mellon
Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

‘ Quantity | Units Description Unit Price Total Bid Price
{per gallon)
300,000 Gallons | 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
per the attached $ nosD $noBiD
specification

Victoria Meakim, Municipal Specialist
Respectfully Submitted

. ,*'I ;/
e [ Lafum
/ (Signature)

Univar Solutions USA Inc.
{Company)

Contact Person: _Victoria Meakim

Telephone Number: _267-397-4074

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.

BID2021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF 15%SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE ~ WATER FILTRATION PLANT OPENING DATE:
12-15-2021 AT 11:00AM



PROPOSAL
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
CALENDAR YEAR 2022
YEAR ONE
The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and Mellon
Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Quantity | Units Description Unit Price Total Bid Price
(per gallon)
300,000 Gallons 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
per the attached $1.29 $387,000. 00
specification

Susan K. Anthony, Sales Administrator
Respectfully Submitted

(Signofu{

Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc.
(Company)

Contact Person: _Susan K. Anthony

Telephone Number: _(973) 589-0700

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.

BID2(021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF 15%SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — WATER FILTRATION PLANT OPENING DATE:
12-15-2021 AT 11:00AM



PROPOSAL
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
CALENDAR YEAR 2023
OPTION TO EXTEND THE CONTRACT FOR ONE (1) YEAR

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochilorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and Mellon
Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Quantity | Units Description Unit Price Total Bid Price
(per gallon)
300,000 Gallons 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
per the attached $ 1 35 $405,000.00
specification

Susan K. Anthony, Sales Administrator
Respectfully Submitted

-,'/: | | /7
"/X\“-'J—Prﬂ "’“ f (;TU {:{;Uf"'--i.--

2 (Signature

Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc.
(Company])

Contact Person: _Susan K. Anthony
Telephone Number: (973) 589-0700

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.

BID2021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF 15%SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — WATER FILTRATION PLANT OPENING DATE:
12-15-2021 AT 11:00AM




PROPOSAL
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
CALENDAR YEAR 2022
YEAR ONE

The undersigned proposes 1o furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and Mellon
Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Quantity I .Enit;

Description Unit Price

300,000 Callons

15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
per the attached $ 1.419
specification l

(per galion)

Total Bid Price
|

|
$425,700.00]
|

Robert A. Allotta

| Respecifully Submitied

" (Signature)
Miracle Chemical Company

{Company)

Contact Person: Robert A. Allotta

Telephone Number:

(732) 938-9110

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of complionce with the bid.

BID2021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF 15%SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — WATER FILTRATION PLANT OPENING DATE:

12-15-2021 AT 11:00AM



PROPOSAL
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
CALENDAR YEAR 2023
OPTION TO EXTEND THE CONTRACT FOR ONE (1) YEAR

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and Mellon
Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

i )

|_Q_uanﬁfy Units Description Unit Price Totai Bld Price
| (per galion)

300,000 Gallons 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
per the attached No Bid $ No Bid
specification |

et

Robert A. Allotta

Respectiully Submitted

o / .

(Signature)

L

Miracle Chemical Company

{Company)

Contact Person: Robert A. Allotta

Telephone Number:  (732) 938-9110

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.

BID2021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF 15%SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — WATER FILTRATION PLANT OPENING DATY:
12-15-2021 AT 11:00AM



PROPOSAL

15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
CALENDAR YEAR 2022

YEAR ONE

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and Mellon
Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Quantity | Units

Description

Unit Price
(per gallon)

Total Bid Price

300,000 Gallons

15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
per the attached
specification

$ 2.00

$ (00,0

ﬁ)mmer Mel\o

Respectfuily Su W d

(Company)

Contact Person: M\e«\\o

Telephone Number: (q\-\\\' 2)50 "\S%—]

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.

BID2021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF 15%SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — WATER FILTRATION PLANT OPENING DATE:

12-15-2021 AT 11:00AM



PROPOSAL
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
CALENDAR YEAR 2023
OPTION TO EXTEND THE CONTRACT FOR ONE (1) YEAR

The undersigned proposes fo furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenuye and Mellon
Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Total Bid Price

$

Quantity | Units | Description Unit Price
(per gallon

300,000 Gallons 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
per the attached $
specification

Resp é’rfuﬁy Submitted

{Signature)

(Company)

Contact Persory

PjiCes shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.

BID2021-78 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF 15%SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE — WATER FILTRATION PLANT OPENING DATE:
12-15-2021 AT 11:00AM



