B1D2023-21 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF ASHBROOK BELT PRESS PARTS FOR A BELT PRESS FOR TRENTON WATER FILTRATION PLANT BID OPENING DATE

MARCH 17, 2023 AT 11:00AM

FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF ASHBROOK
BELT PRESS PARTS FOR A BELT PRESS
FOR WATER FILTRATION PLANT BID
OPENING DATE MARCH17, 2023 AT
11:00AM FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF

WATER AND SEWER

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS: 2
TECHNOLOGY
NAME OF BIDDER ALFA LAVAL, INC. INTERNATIONAL,
INC.
5400 INTERNATIONAL TRADE 1331 SOUTH
ADDRESS DRIVE INTERNATIONAL
LAKE MARY,

CITY, STATE, ZIP
CONTACT NAME

LARRY PACKARD ANDREW PHILIPS

TELEPHONE 281-985-4405 407-359-2373
FAX 281-449-1324 407-359-2372
E_MA"_ larry.packard@a;falaval.com tii@tii-usa.com
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP
DISCLOSURE INCLUDED INCLUDED
PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES IN
RUSSIA AND BELARUS &
INVESTMENT ACTVITIES IN INCLUDED
IRAN INCLUDED
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF
RECEIPT OF ADDENDA INCLUDED INCLUDED
REQUIRED EVIDENCE
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION INCLUDED
REGULATIONS QUESTIONAIRE INCLUDED
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT INCLUDED INCLUDED
AMERICANS WITH
DISABILITIES ACT OF 1990 INCLUDED
LANGUAGE INCLUDED
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE FOR INCLUDED INCLUDED
CONTRACTOR
fIC CERT#21871

EXPIRATION12/15/2024 REQUIRED
MANDATORY EQUAL
EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY INCLUDED
EXHIRIT A INCLUDED
STATE & FEDERAL DEBARMENT
CERTIFICATIONS INCLUDED INCLUDED
ETHICS COMPLAINT
DISCLOSURE INCLUDED INCLUDED
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE  REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD REQUIRED PRIORTO

AWARD

CITY OF TRENTON RESIDENT /A
EMPLOYMENT POLICY N/A
60-DAY EXTENSION VES
COMPLIANCE YES
COMPLIANCE WITH VES
EMERGENCY SERVICES YES
THREE (3) REFERENCES N/A N/A

TOTAL AMOUNT

$59,997.00 SEE
$52,390.83 SEE ATTACHED | ATTACHED BREAK-
BREAK-DOWN OF PRICING DOWN OF PRICING

EXCEPTIONS (IF ANY)

NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW

NONE NONE



mailto:larry.packard@a;falaval.com
mailto:tii@tii-usa.com

Proposal to the City of Trenton Water Works
For the Supply of Ashbrook Belt Press Parts

Calendar Year 2023

ltem Description Quantity | Bid Price
] Belt Scraper, front, ASO03057 12ea. | $ 1,095.96
2 | Belt Scraper, rear, AS310143 6ea. |$ 517.44
3 | Top Belt, ASO38918 6ea. |$20,970.48
4 | Bottom Belt, ASO38919 b6ea. |$21,670.62
5 | Seam Wire A03%2099 20ea. | $ 150.20
6 | Seam Wire A035245 20ea. |$ 269.20
7 | Hydraulic steering cylinder lea. |$ 2,166.60
8 | Belt Alignment Sensors 2ea. |$ 800.58
9 | Texaco Meropa 220 Oil, 5 gal 15ea. |$ 4,749.75

Total $ 52,390.83

Larry Packard

stpedfu'w

(Signature)

Alfa Laval Inc.

(Company)

Person to Contact:  Larry Packard

281-985-4405

Telephone Number:

BID2023-21 FURNISH AND DELIVERY OF ASHBROOK BELT PRESS PARTS FOR A BELT PRESS FOR TRENTON WATER
FILTRATION PLANT BID OPENNG DATE - 3/17/2023 AT 11:00AM



Technology International, Inc.

1331 South International Pkwy, Suite 2251
Lake Mary, FL 32746

Tel: (407) 359-2373

Fax: (407) 359-2372

E-mail: tiii@tii-usa.com

Website: www.tii-usa.com

Equipment Proposal

Description:  Furnish and Delivery of Ashbrook Belt Press Parts for A Belt Press

Bid #: BID2023-21
Attention: Isabel C. Garcia, Purchasing Agent,
City Hall Annex,

1st Floor, City Hall,

319 East State Street,

Trenton, NJ 08608
Tll Ref: TII/NJ/0323/26988
Date: 03/15/2023

In response to your quote request for Furnish and Delivery of Ashbrook Belt Press Parts for A Belt
Press, Technology International, Inc. is pleased to submit the following for consideration:

ITEM | QTY DESCRIPTION/ MODEL NO. UNIT EXTD.

NO. | PRICE PRICE
1 12 | AS003057;BLADE,SCRAPER,KP85/AB85 200 $122.30 $1,467.60
2 6 AS310143;BLADE WDG SCRAPER, KP85 200 $115.60 $693.60
3 6 AS038918;BELT,U KP85 890 200 8065 P/A $4,683.30 | $28,099.80
4 6 ASO3891 9;BELT,L KP85 890 200 8065 P/A $4,834.00 | $29,004.00
5 20 | Belt Seam Wire 904L SS 1.33MM $19.00 $380.00
6 20 | AS035245,SEAM WIRE, 1.5MMx2.54 | $17.60 $352.00
7 1 Hydraulic steering cylinder No Bid No Bid




2 [ Belt Alignment Sensors | NoBid ’ No Bid

No Bid No Bid

15 | Texaco Meropa 220 Qil, 5 gal

See attached data sheets

Warranty: Manufacturer’s standard warranty applies.

Delivery:

Estimated delivery is 15 Weeks after receipt of order and approved submittal.
Please note, due to COVID-19 there may be unanticipated disruptions and delays in the supply

chains globally. for parts, components, equipment and internal manufacturing services such as
engineering, production allocation, and logistics. This may result in manufacturing & delivery

delays out of our control. We will do our best to communicate all such impacts and reduce the

effects of any such delays.
Ali delivery dates quoted are subject to manufacturer's confirmation at time of order.

Submittal data will be provided for approval after receipt of order (if applicable)

Customer to provide equipment and personnel to unload
THl will provide MSO at time of payment confirmation. Customer is responsible for all titling and

registration of trailer (If Applicable)

Freight: Included to Trenton, NJ 08604.

Payment Terms: NET 30
Prompt Payment discount: 1/4 % 10 days

Quote Validity: 60 days.

*** Notes:

Quoted price is not available on a line item basis. This is an offer for a lump sum contract.

Technology International, Inc. Corporate data:

We are a small business ar
quoted does not include an - :

We trust that this proposal |

If you have any questions ¢
fax at 407-359-2372 or em |

Respectfully submitted, ‘

Rt it



