

[illegible]

Fyre Marketing, LLC

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)		50 cases	NO BID		
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)		50 boxes	NO BID		
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)		50 cases	NO BID		
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)		20 cases	NO BID		
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box		20 cases	NO BID		
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head		100 each	NO BID		
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5		100 each	NO BID		
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/ 1 gallon		50 cases	NO BID		
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size S (9 bxs per case)	MD BRAND	50 cases	1,000	39.99	1,999.5
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size M (9 bxs per case)	MD BRAND	50 cases	1,000	39.99	1,999.5
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size L (9 bxs per case)	MD BRAND	50 cases	1,000	39.99	1,999.5
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size XL (9 bxs per case)	MD BRAND	50 cases	1,000	39.99	1,999.5

Interboro Packaging

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent		500 cases			
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent		300 cases			
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	NT-4046-Super Exh Mfr: IBS/Pitt/Glopak	400 cases	100/Case As Per Sample #3	\$26.82	\$10,728.00
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	INT-4046-Super Exh Mfr: IBS/Pitt/Glopak	400 cases	100/Case As per sample #4	\$20.72	\$8,288.00
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	INT-4048-Exh Mfr: IBS/Pitt/Glopak	50 cases	100/Case As Per Samle #5	\$24.32	\$1,216.00
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33	INT-2433-Reg Mfr: IBS/Pitt	100 cases	1,000/Case As per sample #6	\$18.98	\$1,898.00
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance		100 cases			
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)		50 cases			
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)		50 cases			
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)		100 cases			
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White		10 dozen			
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz		30 boxes			

Interboro Packaging

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)		50 cases			
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)		50 boxes			
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)		50 cases			
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)		20 cases			
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box		20 cases			
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head		100 each			
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5		100 each			
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/ 1 gallon		50 cases			
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size S (9 bxs per case)	JobGuard/ Med Pride-Sm-LPFG	50 cases	900/Case Mfr: Med Pride Food Handler	\$32.00 As Per Sample #22	\$1,600
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size M (9 bxs per case)	JobGuard/ Med Pride-Med-LPFG	50 cases	900/Case Mfr: Med Pride Food Handler	\$32.00 As Per Sample #23	\$1,600
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size L (9 bxs per case)	JobGuard/ Med Pride-Lrg-LPFG	50 cases	900/Case Mfr: Med Pride Food Handler	\$32.00 As per sample #24	\$1,600
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size XL (9 bxs per case)	JobGuard/ Med Pride-XL-LPFG	50 cases	900/Case Mfr: Med Pride Food Handler	\$32.00 As Per Sample #25	\$1,600

General Chemical and Supply Inc

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent	160095	500 cases	36/865	\$55.67	\$27,835.00
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent	160068	300 cases	6/800'	\$50.41	\$15,123.00
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	162795	400 cases	100	\$38.88	\$15,552.00
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	163182	400 cases	10/10	\$34.70	\$13,880.00
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	163896	50 cases	10/10	\$38.88	\$1,944.00
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33	162876	100 cases	20/25	\$25.49	\$2,549.00
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance	158540	100 cases	4/2LTR	\$114.52	\$11,452.00
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)	158560	50 cases	4/2LTR	\$62.78	\$3,139.00
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)	Special	50 cases	4/2LTR	\$58.04	\$2,902.00
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)	164713	100 cases	6/1LTR	\$71.21	\$7,121.00
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White		10 dozen		No Bid	No Bid
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz	350213	30 boxes	1000	\$35.31	\$1,059.30

General Chemical and Supply, Inc.

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)	167030	50 cases 50*72 = 3600	12/cs Converts to 300 cases	\$16.54	\$4,962.00
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)	167057	50 boxes	10	\$22.47	\$1,123.50
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)	153017	50 cases	3/144OZ	\$46.16	\$2,308.00
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)	167070	20 cases 20*72 = 1440	12 Converts to 120 cases	\$35.68	\$4,281.60
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box	Special Order	20 cases	25lb	\$49.00	\$980.00
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head	163309	100 each	1 EACH	\$5.42	\$542.00
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5	164236	100 each	12 Converts to 8.3 cases	\$200.12	\$1,661.00
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/ 1 gallon	150160	50 cases	6/1GAL	\$25.71	\$1,285.50
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size S (9 bxs per case)	250256	50 cases	10/100	\$46.23	\$2,311.50
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size M (9 bxs per case)	250258	50 cases	10/100	\$46.23	\$2,311.50
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size L (9 bxs per case)	250260	50 cases	10/100	\$46.23	\$2,311.50
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size XL (9 bxs per case)	250262	50 cases	10/100	\$46.23	\$2,311.50

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent	ESSITY 161990	500 cases	36	57.35	28,675.00
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent	ESSITY 803400	300 cases	6	51.70	15,510.00
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	BETA GREEN46	400 cases	100	34.80	13,920.00
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	PolyETHics BMP46	400 cases	100	26.88	10,752.00
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	PolyETHics PL4671	50 cases	100	28.93	1,446.50
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.6 MIC Size 24 x 33	KANGAROO R2433N12	100 cases	500	24.96	2,496.00
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance	SPARTAN 471602	100 cases	4-2L	95.60	9,560.00
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters / 4 per case)	SPARTAN 483002	50 cases	4-2L	62.21	3,110.50
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters / 4 per case)	SPARTAN 351502	50 cases	4-2L	54.21	2,710.50
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter / 6 per case)	DEBOLJON ANTAL	100 cases	6-1000ML	39.81	3,981.00
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White	WORLDWIDE TOILETSEA	10 dozen	12	334.32	3,343.20
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz	VIC BAY VCLHP8W	30 boxes	1000	46.20	1296.00

Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)	BIG D 689	50 cases	72	79.86	3,993.00
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)	FRESH 3WDS-F	50 boxes	10	19.26	963.00
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)	Clorox 35458	50 cases	3	44.97	2,248.50
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)	BIG D 661	20 cases	72	104.76	2,095.20
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box	BALL TRADING 7202	20 cases	25 lbs	63.21	1,264.20
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head	VIC BAY 90135B	100 each	1	3.61	361.00
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5	MONARCH M850024	100 each	1	5.98	598.00
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/1 gallon	PORE BRIGHT	50 cases	6	20.86	1,043.00
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size S (9 bxs per case)	VIC BAY 62323PFS	50 cases	10/100	39.45	1,972.50
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size M (9 bxs per case)	VIC BAY 62323PFM	50 cases	10/100	39.45	1,972.50
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size L (9 bxs per case)	VIC BAY 62323PFL	50 cases	10/100	39.45	1,972.50
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size XL (9 bxs per case)	VIC BAY 62323PFL	50 cases	10/100	39.45	1,972.50

CITY OF TRENTON NUMBERS

Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC

\$ 28,675.00
\$ 15,510.00
\$ 13,920.00
\$ 10,752.00
\$ 1,446.50
\$ 2,496.00
\$ 9,560.00
\$ 3,110.50
\$ 2,710.50
\$ 3,981.00
\$ 3,343.20
\$ 1,296.00
\$ 3,993.00
\$ 963.00
\$ 2,248.50
\$ 2,095.20
\$ 1,264.20
\$ 361.00
\$ 598.00
\$ 1,043.00
\$ 1,972.50
\$ 1,972.50
\$ 1,972.50
\$ 1,972.50
\$ 117,256.60

ACE & R Supply Co., LLC

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent	Renown is not the brand for Eco-Soft Green Seal Opti-Core toilet tissue - It is made by TORK Paper Goods Co. - #T16199	500 cases	36 rolls / case	\$65.97/cs	\$32,985.00
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent	Renown is a not the brand for EcoSoft - Green Seal Roll Towels - it is made by NITTANY Paper Co. #N6800-YN (Y-Notch)	300 cases	6 rolls / case	\$44.94/cs	\$13,482.00
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	XLPLASTICS INTL Made in the USA #XGRN4046HD1.5	400 cases	100 bags / case	\$24.84/cs	\$9,936.00
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	XLPLASTICS INTL Made in the USA #XBLK4046HD1.5	400 cases	100 bags / case	\$23.84/cs	\$9,536.00
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	XLPLASTICS INTL Made in the USA #XCLR4048-1.4	50 cases	100 bags / case	\$22.84/cs	\$1,142.00
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33	XLPLASTICS INTL Made in the USA #XCLR2433-16MIC	100 cases	500 bags / case	\$21.84/cs	\$2,184.00
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance	SPARTAN C.O.T.G NABC-1 Non-Acid Cleaner Concentrate #SP71602	100 cases	4 X 2 Liters per case	\$129.98/cs	\$12,998.00
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)	SPARTAN C.O.T.G TRIBASE-17 Multi-Purpose Cleaner #SP83002	50 cases	4 X 2 Liters per case	\$74.96/cs	\$3,748.00
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)	SPARTAN C.O.T.G GRN SOLUTION-105 Industrial Non-Toxic Cleaner #SP51502	50 cases	4 X 2 Liters per case	\$75.96/cs	\$3,798.00
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)	AeroGreen sold to SCJohnson - New Product Name is REFRESH #57250	100 cases	6 X 1 Liter cartidges per case	\$59.95/cs	\$5,995.00
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White	EZ-FLO BATH MFG Comm'l Grade Open Front Elongated Wht Toilet Seat #5914	10 dozen	4 seats per cs	\$24.45 per unit \$293.40 per dozen 10doz = 120 units	\$2,934.00
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz	DART STYRO H/C J-CUPS SPECIFY SIZE #J6J OR #J8J	30 boxes	1,000 cups per box 40 sleeves of 25 ea	\$41.60/cs specify cup size 6 oz. or 8 oz.	\$1,248.00

Sub-Total Pg 4: Line items 1-12: \$99,986.00

ACJ&R Supply Co., LLC

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)	Appeal Brand is Made in CHINA for Amazon. We offer LAVEX brand made in USA #71657	50 cases	24 units per box X 3 boxes per case = 72 units per case	\$99.72/cs	\$4,986.00
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)	Fresh Products Wave 3D Urinal Dead Scr Mango 3WDS-MGCL-10	50 boxes	10 Screens per box X 50 bxs = 500 units	\$32.50/bx	\$1,625.00
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)	Pine-Sol Brand Disinfectant Cleaner #35418	50 cases	3 X 48-oz bottles per case	\$46.20/cs	\$2,310.00
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)	Renown Chemical 3.5oz Cherry Toilet Rim Deod Hanger #RE3003FR	20 cases	12 units per box X 6 boxes per case = 72 units per case	\$32.40/cs	\$648.00
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box	PRO-QUALITY WHT T-SHIRT WIPERS Y-PER MFG #2374	20 cases	25-lbs per unit	\$45.50/cs	\$910.00
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head	ACJ&R PREMIUM 4-Ply 24-oz Rayon Cut End Mop Head #N0424	100 each	25 units per box X 4 boxes = 100	\$6.79 each	\$679.00
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5	ACJ&R PREMIUM Synthetic Looped Blue Dust Mop Head - #N6424	100 each	25 units per box X 4 boxes = 100	\$8.69 each	\$869.00
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/ 1 gallon	KIK Products 6% Pure Bright Germicidal Ultra Bleach #35042	50 cases	6 X 1 gallon jugs per case	\$41.98/cs	\$2,099.00
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size S (9 bxs per case)	VANGUARD SAFETY EQUIP CORP - #33A11	50 cases	100 Gloves per box - 10 bxs per case = 1,000 total	\$32.97/cs	\$1,648.50
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size M (9 bxs per case)	VANGUARD SAFETY EQUIP CORP - #33A12	50 cases	100 Gloves per box - 10 bxs per case = 1,000 total	\$32.97/cs	\$1,648.50
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size L (9 bxs per case)	VANGUARD SAFETY EQUIP CORP - #33A13	50 cases	100 Gloves per box - 10 bxs per case = 1,000 total	\$32.97/cs	\$1,648.50
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size XL (9 bxs per case)	VANGUARD SAFETY EQUIP CORP - #33A14	50 cases	100 Gloves per box - 10 bxs per case = 1,000 total	\$32.97/cs	\$1,648.50

Sub-Total Pg 5: Line items 13-25: \$20,720.00

Total Pg 4 & 5: Line items 1-25: \$120,706.00

United Sales USA Corp

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent	Morcon	500 cases	36/cs	29.54	14,769.00
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent	Nittany	300 cases	6/cs	37.80	11,340.00
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	exact Alright	400 cases	100/cs	28.05	11,220.00
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	exact Alright	400 cases	100/cs	18.49	7,395.40
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	exact Alright	50 cases	100/cs	21.75	10,875.00
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33	equal Alright	100 cases		19.00	1,900.00
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance		100 cases			
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)		50 cases			
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)		50 cases			
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)	SC Johnson	100 cases	6/cs	73.90	7,389.00
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White		10 dozen			
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz	Dart	30 boxes	1000/cs	37.15	1,114.56

United Sales USA Corp

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)	Scentbon	50 cases	12/pk	13.97	698.40
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)	Scentbon	50 boxes	10/pk	17.21	860.40
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)	Pine-sol	50 cases	3/cs	33.06	1653.00
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)		20 cases			
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box		20 cases	25lb box	25.00	500.00
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head		100 each			
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5		100 each	12/each	11.91	1,191.40
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/ 1 gallon		50 cases			
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size S (9 bxs per case)	Pro stat	50 cases	10 boxes/cs	35.65	1782.50
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size M (9 bxs per case)	Pro stat	50 cases	10 boxes/cs	35.65	1782.50
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size L (9 bxs per case)	Pro stat	50 cases	10 boxes/cs	35.65	1782.50
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size XL (9 bxs per case)	Pro stat	50 cases	10 boxes/cs	35.65	1782.50

Term Enterprise Inc. T/A Allen Paper + Supply Company

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent		500 cases			
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent		300 cases			
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	Aluf Green Repro	400 cases ALUF GR-REP	100/cs.	\$41.00	\$16,400 *This is a custom bag and must be ordered in lots of 100
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	PG6 46x46 Aluf Black Repro	400 cases	100/cs.	\$34.50	\$13,800 sample included
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	Aluf CRL 40x48	50 cases	50	\$23.00	\$1150 sample included
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33	Aluf Hi-D Clear	100 cases	1000	\$78.00	\$7800 *This is a custom bag and must be ordered in lots of 100.
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance		100 cases			
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)		50 cases			
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)		50 cases			
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)		100 cases			
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White		10 dozen			
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz		30 boxes			

TEKM Enterprise Inc. T/A Allen Paper + Supply Company

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)		50 cases			
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)	Wave	50 boxes	10	\$30 ⁰⁰	\$1500
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)	Clorox Pine Sol	50 cases	3/144 ¹²	\$48 ⁵⁰	\$2425
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)	Fresh Rim basket	20 cases	6/12	\$130 ⁰⁰	\$2600
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box		20 cases			
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head		100 each			
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5		100 each			
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/1 gallon	A-1 Elite 6% Bleach	50 cases	6	\$26 ⁰⁰	\$1300
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size S (9 bxs per case)	Emerald PF252	50 cases	10/100 per case	\$42 ⁰⁰	\$2100
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size M (9 bxs per case)	Emerald PF251	50 cases	10/100 per case	\$42 ⁰⁰	\$2100
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size L (9 bxs per case)	Emerald PF250	50 cases	10/100 per case	\$42 ⁰⁰	\$2100
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size XL (9 bxs per case)	Emerald PF256	50 cases	10/100 per case	\$42 ⁰⁰	\$2100

EXCEPTIONS
(IF NONE, PLEASE NOTE)

Aluf CRL-404715 is 1.5 mil vs. 1.4 in specs.
and 40x47 vs. 40x48 in specs.

The Renown Toilet Rim Hanger - I am quoting
the item by Fresh. Same item made by a
different manufacturer.

RMAC Supplies

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent	NITTANY NPP-486162R	500 cases	48	\$39.52	\$19,760.00
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent	NITTANY NPP-6800EW	300 cases	6	\$31.46	\$9,588.00
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	/	400 cases			
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	RMAC Bag-4047XB	400 cases	100	\$23.64	\$9,456.00
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	RMAC 56C	50 cases	100	\$27.44	\$1,372.00
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.6 MIC Size 24 x 33	NOVAMED NOR-RST24324C	100 cases	500	\$25.67	\$2,567.00
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance	/	100 cases			
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)	/	50 cases			
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)	/	50 cases			
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)	/	100 cases			
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White	Bemis HBC-CTS380W	10 dozen	12	\$194.52	\$1945.20
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz	POP TOP CUP PP	30 boxes	1,000	\$31.27	\$938.10

RMAC Supplies

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)	JANICLO JAN-7001	50 cases	72	\$ 97.98	\$ 4899.00
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)	VECTAIR VEC-wee-Screen-CITRUS	50 boxes	10	\$ 18.24	\$ 912.00
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)	PINE SOL CLO-35419	50 cases	3	\$ 40.24	\$ 2012.00
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)	/	20 cases			
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box	/	20 cases			
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head	JANICLO JAN-3742	100 each 8 cases	12	\$ 73.56	\$ 588.48
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5	/	100 each			
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/ 1 gallon	Pure Bright KIK-962	50 cases	6	\$ 2380	\$ 1,190.00
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size S (9 bxs per case)	RMAC LDPF-S	50 cases	11000	\$ 31.33	\$ 1,566.50
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size M (9 bxs per case)	RMAC LDPF-M	50 cases	11000	\$ 31.33	\$ 1,566.50
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size L (9 bxs per case)	RMAC LDPF-L	50 cases	11000	\$ 31.33	\$ 1,566.50
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size XL (9 bxs per case)	RMAC LDPF-XL	50 cases	11000	\$ 31.33	\$ 1,566.50

Ferguson Enterprises LLC

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent	/	500 cases	/	/	/
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent	/	300 cases	/	/	/
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	/	400 cases	/	/	/
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	West Craft WCL40465K	400 cases	100/case	32.213	12885.20
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	/	50 cases	/	/	/
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33	/	100 cases	/	/	/
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance	SPAR471602	100 cases	4/case	102.280	10228.00
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)	SPA483002	50 cases	4/case	55.813	2790.65
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)	3483502	50 cases	4/case	66.053	3302.65
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)	SANT1L	100 cases	6/case	46.60	4660.00
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White	PFTSCOF2000WH	10 dozen	120 each	26.390	3166.80
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz	/	30 boxes	/	/	/

Ferguson Enterprises LLC

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)	JS95250	50 cases	6/case	3.467	173.35
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)	F3WDSF0101060M02	50 boxes	10/box	21.187	1059.35
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)	CL035418CT	50 cases	3/case	49.333	2466.65
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)	FEBCF0121072M02	20 cases	12/pack	25.667	513.34
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box	BOX10084 PB	20 cases	Box	23.20	464.00
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head	NFGV41800WH00	100 each	Ea	6.050	605.00
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5	ADMTL16524BFE	100 each	Ea	7.133	713.30
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/1 gallon	C3B110016	50 cases	6/case price each	3.514	1054.20
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size S (9 bxs per case)	WC106738	50 cases	Box	6.990	3145.50
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size M (9 bxs per case)	WC106739	50 cases	Box	6.990	3145.50
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size L (9 bxs per case)	WC106740	50 cases	Box	6.990	3145.50
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size XL (9 bxs per case)	WC106741	50 cases	Box	6.990	3145.50

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent	TORK	500 cases	36	71. ⁴¹	35,705. ⁰⁰ ^{EM}
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent	^{EM} TORK	300 cases	6	57. ⁹⁷	17,391. ⁰⁰
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	Plastic PRINCE	400 cases	100	38. ⁰⁰	15,200. ⁰⁰
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	Plastic PRINCE	400 cases	100	34. ¹⁰	13,640. ⁰⁰
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	Plastic PRINCE	50 cases	100	27. ⁷¹	1,385. ³⁰
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33	Plastic PRINCE	100 cases	1000	37. ⁰⁷	3,707. ⁰⁰
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance	Betco	100 cases	4-1 GAL	79. ⁹⁵	7,995. ⁰⁰
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)	ZEP	50 cases	4-1 GAL	48. ³²	2,416. ⁰⁰
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)	Betco	50 cases	4-2 LITER	99. ⁸²	4,991. ¹⁰
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)	As spec ^{EM}	100 cases	6-1 LITER	98. ⁹⁹	9,899. ⁰⁰
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White	HAYFAIR	10 dozen	EACH	30. ²⁰	3,624. ⁰⁰
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz	DART	30 boxes	1000	38. ⁸⁹	1,166. ⁷⁰

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)	Hospeco	50 cases	72	124. ⁹⁹	6249. ⁵⁰
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)	AS Spec	50 boxes	10	23. ⁸⁹	1,194. ⁵⁰
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)	AS Spec	50 cases	3	41. ⁰¹	2,050. ⁵⁰
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)	Hospeco	20 cases	72	164. ⁸⁰	3,296. ⁰⁰
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box	Hospeco	20 cases	25LB	49. ⁹⁹	999. ⁸⁰
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head	Boardwalk	100 each	EACH	7. ⁰¹	701. ⁰⁰
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5	Boardwalk	100 each	EACH	16. ¹⁶	1,616. ⁰⁰
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/ 1 gallon	PURE BRIGHT	50 cases	6-1 GAL	29. ⁶⁵	1,482. ⁵⁰
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size S (9 bxs per case)	Emerald	50 cases	10 BOXES	89. ⁹⁹	4,499. ⁵⁰
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size M (9 bxs per case)	Emerald	50 cases	10 BOXES	89. ⁹⁹	4,499. ⁵⁰
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size L (9 bxs per case)	Emerald	50 cases	10 BOXES	89. ⁹⁹	4,499. ⁵⁰
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves - Size XL (9 bxs per case)	Emerald	50 cases	10 BOXES	89. ⁹⁹	4,499. ⁵⁰

Unipack, Corp

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent		500 cases			
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent		300 cases			
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46		400 cases	100	16.50	6600-
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46		400 cases	100	14.60	5840-
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48		50 cases	100	18.88	944-
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33		100 cases	500 250	13.88	1388-
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance		100 cases			
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)		50 cases			
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)		50 cases			
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)		100 cases			
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White		10 dozen			
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz		30 boxes			

Unipack, Corp

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)		50 cases			
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)		50 boxes			
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)		50 cases			
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)		20 cases			
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box		20 cases			
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head		100 each			
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5		100 each			
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/1 gallon		50 cases			
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size S (9 bxs per case)		50 cases	10/100	27.90	1395-
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size M (9 bxs per case)		50 cases	10/100	27.90	1395-
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size L (9 bxs per case)		50 cases	10/100	27.90	1395-
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size XL (9 bxs per case)		50 cases	10/100	27.90	1395-

BID PROPOSAL FORM

INTECH Inc.
N. 1000 St.
Gloucester City, NJ 08030
856-456-6100 / Fax 856-456-1904

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent	—	500 cases	—	NO	BID
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent	—	300 cases	—	NO	BID
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	RENATURE GREEN 40x46 2 mil 100/cs	400 cases	100/cs.	64.00	25,600.00
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	CAN GUARD 40x46 100/cs 1.5 MIL	400 cases	100/cs.	38.95	15,580.00
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	—	50 cases	—	NO	BID
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33	ADVANTAGE 24x33 16 500/cs	100 cases	500/cs	38.50	3,850.00
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance	—	100 cases	—	NO	BID
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)	—	50 cases	—	NO	BID
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)	—	50 cases	—	NO	BID
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)	REFRESH DEB 6/1	100 cases	6/1 LITER	84.50	8,450.00
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White	—	10 dozen	—	NO	BID
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz	FS TRANS 902 12/80 cups = 960	30 boxes	960	56.00	1,680.00

INDCO Inc.

P.O. Box 100

N. Felt - Essex St.

Gloucester, MA 01930

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)	FRESH CHOICE Block/Screen 12/BX	50 cases	12/BX 6 per M/c	138.00	6,900.00
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)	FRESH PROD. EXACT	50 boxes	10/BX	26.00	1,300.00
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)	3/144 Pine Sol. 35418	50 cases	3 per	52.00	2,600.00
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)	—	20 cases	—	NO	BID
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box	—	20 cases	—	NO	BID
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head	24 INDCO DANDY Rayon	100 each		8.99	899.00
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5	—	100 each	—	NO	BID
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/ 1 gallon	KIK 962	50 cases	6/1 gal	28.00	1,400.00
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size S (9 bxs per case)	PROF CHOICE	50 cases	10 BOXES per case	63.00	3,150.00
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size M (9 bxs per case)	PROF CHOICE	50 cases	10 BOXES per case	63.00	3,150.00
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size L (9 bxs per case)	PROF CHOICE	50 cases	10 BOXES per case	63.00	3,150.00
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size XL (9 bxs per case)	PROF CHOICE	50 cases	10 BOXES per case	63.00	3,150.00

Central Poly Bag Corporation

BID PROPOSAL FORM

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
1	Renown EcoSoft Green Seal Opti-Core Toilet Tissue or Equivalent		500 cases			
2	Renown Ecosoft Green Seal Roll Towel or Equivalent		300 cases			
3	Green Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	Central Poly	400 cases	100	35.00	14,000.00
4	Black Trash Can Liners Strength: Heavy Duty (minimum 1.5 MIL) Size 40 x 46	Central Poly	400 cases	100	16.80	6,720.00
5	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 1.4 MIL Size 40 x 48	Central Poly	50 cases	100	19.20	960.00
6	Clear Trash Can Liners Strength: 16 MIC Size 24 x 33	Central Poly	100 cases	500	21.00	2,100.00
7	Clean on the Go NABC Cleaner Floral Fragrance		100 cases			
8	Clean on the Go Tri-Base Multi-Purpose Cleaner (2 liters /4 per case)		50 cases			
9	Clean on the Go Green Solution (2 liters/4 per case)		50 cases			
10	Aerogreen Antibac Foam Soap (1 liter/6 per case)		100 cases			
11	Toilet Seat Open Front Elongated White		10 dozen			
12	Hot/Cold Cups 6-8 oz		30 boxes			

Central Poly Bag Corporation

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	INSERT BRAND OR EQUIVALENT BRAND	CITY'S ESTIMATED QUANTITY NEEDED	VENDOR MUST INDICATE HOW MANY ITEMS PACK IN A CASE	PRICE PER CASE	VENDOR MUST MULTIPLY UNIT PRICE X PRICE PER CASE = TOTAL PRICE
13	Appeal Deodorizing Block and Screen (72 per case)		50 cases			
14	The Wave 3D Urinal Screen (10 per box)		50 boxes			
16	Pine-Sol 144 oz (3 per case)		50 cases			
17	Renown Toilet Rim Hanger (72 per case)		20 cases			
18	T-Shirt Wipers, Eagle Pro 2374 25 lb box		20 cases			
19	4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Mop Head		100 each			
20	Premium Synthetic Blue Dust Mop Head Size 24 x 5		100 each			
21	Bleach 6% Pure Bright 6/ 1 gallon		50 cases			
22	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size S (9 bxs per case)		50 cases			
23	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size M (9 bxs per case)		50 cases			
24	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size L (9 bxs per case)		50 cases			
25	Latex Powder Free Gloves – Size XL (9 bxs per case)		50 cases			