BID2024-06 FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE FOR TRENTON WATER FILTRATION PLANT - BID OPENING DATE 2/21/2024 AT 11:00AM

BID2024-06 FURNISHING AND DELIVERY
OF 15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE FOR
THE DEPARTMENT OF WATER AND
SEWER , TRENTON WATER FILTRATION
PLANT - VIRTUAL BID OPENING
FEBRUARY 21, 2024 AT 11:00AM
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS: 4
UNIVAR JCI JONES
NAME OF BIDDER SOLUTIONS USA,| CHEMICALS, BRENNTAG KUEHNE CHEMICAL
INC INC. NORTHEAST, LLC co., INC.
200 DEAN 86 N. HACKENSACK
ADDRESS SIEVERS PLACE | 103 RIVER ST. | 81 W. JULLER LANE AVENUE
MORRISVILLE, | WARWICK, NY  READING, PA
CITY, STATE, ZIP PA 19067 10990 19605 KEARNY, NJ 07032
VICTORIA JENNIFER KRISTEN
CONTACT NAME MEAKIM NESTOR ODONNELL SUSAN K. ANTHONY
TELEPHONE 215-337-5403 | 845-986-1715 | 484-818-1687 973-589-0700
FAX ~ N/A | 845986-0619 N/A 973-589-4866
E -MA| |. oz ns.com = jaar em.com kirsten.o'dor tag.com com
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE
INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES IN RUSSIA AND
BELARUS & INVESTMENT ACTVITIES IN
IRAN
INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF
ADDENDA INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
REQUIRED EVIDENCE AFFIRMATIVE
ACTION REGULATIONS QUESTIONAIRE
INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT OF
1990 LANGUAGE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE FOR CONTRACTOR INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
EIC CERT#28919 | CERT#1338 | CERT#555EXP. = CERT.#6584 EXP.
EXP. 8/15/2026 |EXP.5/15/2025  8/15/2024 1/15/2025
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT
OPPORTUNITY EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
STATE & FEDERAL DEBARMENT
CERTIFICATIONS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
ETHICS COMPLAINT DISCLOSURE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
REQUIRED FROM REFQRE)'::D REQUIRED FROM | Lo oo om
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE AWARDED AWARDED
PROPOSER AWARDED PROPOSER  AWARDED PROPOSER
PROPOSER
CITY OF TRENTON RESIDENT
EMPLOYMENT POLICY INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
60-DAY EXTENSION COMPLIANCE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED YES
COMPLIANCE WITH EMERGENCY
SERVICES YES YES YES YES
THREE (3) REFERENCES YES YES YES N/A
W-9 N/A N/A N/A N/A
UNIT PRICE PER GALLON AND TOTAL $1.775 $2.26 $2.95 $2.95
AMOUNT 2024 $621,250.00 | $791,000.00 | $1,032,500.00 $1,032,500.00
UNIT PRICE PER GALLON AND TOTAL $2.46
AMOUNT OTE 2025 NO BID $861,000.00 NO BID NO BID
EXCEPTIONS (IF ANY) NONE vEs vES NONE
FATAL FLAW NONE NONE NONE NONE



mailto:victoria.meakim@univarsolutions.com
mailto:victoria.meakim@univarsolutions.com
mailto:waarwick@jcichem.com
mailto:waarwick@jcichem.com
mailto:bids@kuehnecompany.com

Proposal

15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
Calendar Year 2024

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and

Mellon Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

r Quantity | Units | Description Unit Price Total Bid Price
L (per gallon)

350,000 | Gallons | 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as |

; ver the attached specification | $ 1.775/GAL $ 621,250.00 |

Victoria Meakim, Municipal Specialist

Respectfully Submitted

%W/ Q/CAJ(J/;’H

(Signature)

Univar Solutions USA LLC

(Company)

Contact Person: Victoria Meakim

Telephone Number: 215-337-5403

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.



Proposal
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
Calendar Year 2025

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and

Mellon Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Puantity [Units | Description Unit Price Total Bid Price
_| . ] (per gallon)
‘ 350,000 | Gallons | 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
per the attached specification $ No Bid $ NoBid

No Bid

Respectfully Submitted

No Bid

(Signature)

No Bid

(Company)

Contact Person: No Bid

Telephone Number: _No Bid

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.




Proposal

15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
Calendar Year 2024

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and

Mellon Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Quantity | Units Description Unit Price
(per gallon)

Total Bid Price

350,000 | Gallons | 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
i per the attached specification

$ 226

$ 791,000.00 ]

Jennifer Nestor

Respectfully Submitted

)ty

’ <’ (Signature)

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.

(Company)

Contact Person: Jennifer Nestor

Telephone Number: 845.986.1715

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.



Proposal
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
Calendar Year 2025

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and

Mellon Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

J :

Quantity | Units Deseription Unit Price Total Bid Price 1
Al (per gallon)
350,000 | Gallons | 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as
: per the attached specification | $ 2.46 $ 861,000.00

Jennifer Nestor

Res; ectfully Submitted

OVl

(Signature)

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.
(Company)

Contact Person: Jennifer Nestor

Telephone Number: 845.986.1715

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.



J]oncs Chemicals Inc.

BID ADDENDUM

1. The chlorine Producers have declared Force Majeure a combined eleven times since 2021.
Chlorine supply remains on strict allocation. In September 2022, all chlorine shipments in the
nation were halted for a week, and were behind schedule for several more, due to the threat of a rail

strike,

JCI has no control over raw material supply or its transportation, and we must ensure that we are
not penalized should we be rendered unable to deliver by any disrupting event beyond our control.

Therefore, JCI must respectfully insist on including the following Force Majeure clause, or one of
your choosing that is approved by IC], as a term of our bid and any related contract that may be

issued.

FORCE MAJEURE: ]JCI Jones Chemicals shall not be responsible for damages or delays
caused by Force Majeure nor other events beyond its control and which could not
reasonably have been anticipated or prevented. For purposes of this Agreement,
Force Majeure includes, but is not limited to, adverse weather conditions, floods,
epidemics, war, riot, strikes, lockouts, and other industrial disturbances; unknown
site conditions, accidents, sabotage, fire, and acts of God.

Please note that Force Majeure is of no relation to pricing- it is supply related only. JCI's pricing and
price terms will always remain as-bid regardless of Force Majeure status.

2. JCI's payment terms are Net 30 days.

Corporate Offices o 1765 Ringling Blvd. » Sarasota, Florida 34236 e teleplione: 941.330.1537 o facsimile: 941.330.9657 = 800.477.1078
Branch Locations e Warwick, NY e Caledonia, NY » Barberton, OH s Riverview, MI « Merrimack, NH e Charlotte, NC
Jacksonville, FL » Beech Grove, IN e Milford, VA ¢ Tacoma, WA e Torrance, CA
www jcichemicals.com



Proposal

15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
Calendar Year 2024

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and

Mellon Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Quantity | Units Description ' Unit Price | Total Bid Price |
L (per gallon) | !
350,000 | Gallons | 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as 00
| per the attached specification $ qu 5 ‘ $ l D) 05215w.

%2000 gallon MINIENLIM Order

3 theag} LLO
il pé‘\cbg‘my. SubmiﬁedK\rS'\'en O'D()ﬁnen

" (Bignature)

&mﬁ%«%\m@-&
Contact Person: K\FS‘\'eﬂ Ol DOﬂ\'\d‘
Telephone Number: L\%"\ - 8\8 - “08 '7

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.



Proposal
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
Calendar Year 2025

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and

Mellon Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Quantity | Units | Description | Unit Pr_icé_ : Total Bid Price
| (per gallon) ‘

350,000 | Gallons | 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as B
3 per the attached specification ! $ NO 6|D $ \Q ‘

KigtenO0onpell

Respectfully Submitted

B I : (gignature) | '

Q)rem’rao Noctheoal LLC

(Zompany)

Contact Person: K\_Y;QEH_D'_&)_DY\Q/“
Telephone Number: Wri

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.



Proposal
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
Calendar Year 2024

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and

Mellon Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Quantity | Units Description Unit Price Total Bid Price ‘

L (per gallon) !

350,000 | Gallons | 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as | |
’. per the attached specification $ O? QS $ / 032 vaqDO

Susan K. Anthqny

1
9&@@ .;A/ LK
(Slgnature)

Kuehne (hemical CD

(Company)

Contact Person: .SJ\SAN /é 4 /‘717))(%\
Telephone Number: q/) 5_ 15/87/0'?/

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.

Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.



Proposal
15% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
Calendar Year 2025

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver 15% Sodium Hypochlorite, as per the
specifications, to the Trenton Water Works Reservoir Gatehouse, Pennington Avenue and

Mellon Street, Trenton, New Jersey as per the following:

Unit Price Total Bid Price
(per gallon)

350,000 | Gallons | 15% Sodium Hypochlorite as ’% .
per the attached specification | $ M O l& $

Quantity | Units Description

Susan K. Anthony

istrator
Respectfully Submitted

Hossck! (Z Mo

(Signature)

Contact Person:

Telephone Number:

Prices shall be firm for the length of this contract.
Attach all chemical analysis and affidavits of compliance with the bid.



