B1D2025-47

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF PROMOTIONAL ITEMS FOR DEPARTMETN OF RECREATION, NATURAL RESOURCES, AND CULTURE FOR A
PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR - VIRTUAL BID OPENING DATE 5/8/2025 AT 11:00AM

NUMBER OF BIDS SUBMITTED

3

NAME OF PROPOSER

SMART STICH, INC.

CONCEPT PRINT

GREEN HOUSE GRAPHICS, LLC

ADDRESS

129 WALTERS AVENUE

40 LYDECKER STREET

1722 OLD TRENTON ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP

EWING, NEW JERSEY 08638

NYACK, NY 10960

WEST WINDSOR, NJ 08550

CONTACT NAME

JUNTARTI NJOTOPRAWIRO

KELLEY DIONNE

JOHN HAUSELT

TELEPHONE 609-945-1487 845-353-4040 609-443-1722

FAX 609-530-1487 845-353-3030 N/A

E-MAIL YmYm@Srr:sr{t\ErhEmbrmde Kelley@conceptprint.com info@greenhousegraphics.net
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
PROHIBITED INVESTMENT ACTVITIES IN IRAN INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

| ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF

ARDENDA N/A N/A N/A

REQUIRED EVIDENCE AFFIRMATIVE ACTION

REGULATIONS QUESTIONAIRE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT - MADATORY INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT OF 1990

LANGUAGE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE REQUIRED PRIOR TO

FOR CONTRACTOR INCLUDED AWARD REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD

CERTIFICATE OF EMPLOYEE INFORMATION

CERT#75161 EXP.

CERT#19105 EXP.

REQUUIRED FROM AWARDED
PROPOSER WITH SIGNED

(EIC) 1/15/2032 5/15/2030 CONTRACTS
REQUIRED EVIDENCE AFFIRMATIVE ACTION

REGULATIONS QUESTIONAIRE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT

OPPORTUNITY EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
STATE & FEDERAL DEBARMENT

CERTIFICATIONS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
ETHICS COMPLAINT DISCLOSURE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED
PROPOSER WITH SIGNED
CONTRACTS

REQUIRED FROM
AWARDED PROPOSER
WITH SIGNED
CONTRACTS

REQUIRED FROM AWARDED
PROPOSER WITH SIGNED
CONTRACTS

CITY OF TRENTON RESIDENT EMPLOYMENT
POLICY

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

SEE ATTACHED UNIT PRICING FOR EACH
ITEM

SEE ATTACHED UNIT
PRICING FOR EACH ITEM

SEE ATTACHED UNIT
PRICING FOR EACH ITEM

SEE ATTACHED UNIT PRICING
FOR EACH ITEM

60-DAY EXTENSION COMPLIANCE TES YES YES
COMPLIANCE WITH EMERGENCY SERVICES NO YES YES
EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE
THREE (3) REFERENCES INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
FATAL FLAW NONE NONE NONE



mailto:YinYin@SmartStichEmbroidery.com
mailto:YinYin@SmartStichEmbroidery.com
mailto:Kelley@conceptprint.com
mailto:info@greenhousegraphics.net

ITEM

QTY

Description

UNIT

PRICE
Bags 16x12  |1,000 |Various Colors with City Seal 1.27
Bags N/A 500 Black Bags w/ Pink handles - with City Seal 4.50
Bags N/A 1,000 |Orange Frosted Pumpkin Bag with City Seal 1.50

13"W X |
Bags 15"H X (3,500 |Black Insulated Grocery Tote 5.95
9

Bags N/A 1,000 [Holiday Tote =~ _ NO BID
Bags N/A 125 Recycled Convention Tote Bag Charcoal 7.55
Bags N/A 500  |Stripe Canvas Tote Bags 13.25
Ball N/A 10 |Full size basketballs printed with City Logo NOBID
Ball 9" 150 Basketball 'NOBID
Ball 9" 150 Soccer NOBID
Ball 9" 150 Baseball NO BID
Ball 9" 150 Football NO BID
Bottles 200z |500 Basecamp Tundra Bottle w/Screw top lid 18.00
Bottles 200z 250  |Kelly Green w/ lid 2.50
Bottles 280z |250  |Neon Orange 4.25
Bottles 200z |500  |Water Bottles White w/ Blue Top 2.00
Bottles 300z |500 |Water Bottle Red w/ White 4.50
Bracelet |N/A 300 Woven bracelet 1.25
Candle [N/A__ [300 |Tranquility Scented Candle - Apple 3.50
Cloth N/A 500 Microfiber Cleaning cloth Green 2.00
Decoration [N/A 500 Nickel Snowflake Holiday Ornament 5.00
Decoration |N/A 500  [Christmas Tree Holiday Ornament 6.25
Fan N/A 500 Folding Fan 2.25
Hats N/A 52 |Forestw/ White 7.13
Hats N/A 500 Sun Visor 3.75
Hats N/A 1000 |Santa Hat 3.75

Smart Stitch inc.




Hoodies

15

Royal blue printed DTF on front

17.00

in White DTF size max 3" diameter
: Royal blue printed DTF on front
Hoodies (M 15 in White DTF size max 3" diameter 17.00
: Royal blue printed DTF on front
Hoodies L 15 in White DTF size max 3" diameter 17.00
: Royal blue printed DTF on front ,
Hoodes X 1"  linwhte  DTF size max 3" diameter | 7%
. Royal blue printed DTF on front
Hoodies | XXL ° in White DTF size max 3" diameter 2475
Hoodies Youth 45 Neon Blue 15.85
Small
Hoodies Y, M 65 Neon Blue 15.85
Hoodies |Y, L 40 Neon Blue 15.85
Hoodies |Y, XL [10 Neon Blue 15.85
Keychain [N/A 300 Bamboo Leatherette/Metal Round 475
Keychain [N/A 600 Custom Nylon Keychain Strap 1.50
Keyring N/A 500 Super Plush 4.00
Lanyard |N/A 150 Royal Biue 1.25
Long
Sleeve S 250 Various Colors with City Seal 10.00
Tee
Long
Sleeve M 250 Various Colors with City Seal 10.00
Tee
Long
Sleeve L 250 Various Colors with City Seal 10.00
Tee
Long |
Sleeve XL 250 Various Colors with City Seal 10.00
Tee
Long
Sleeve XXL 100 Various Colors with City Seal 11.50
Tee
Long
Sleeve :\(ﬂout.h 100  |Various Colors with City Seal 9.00
Tee edium

Smart Stitch Inc.




Long

Sleeve Y.L 100 Various Colors with City Seal 9.00

Tee

Long

Sleeve Y, XL |100 Various Colors with City Seal 9.00

Tee

Pens N/A 500 ;;e Christmas Multi-Color Inkbend Xtra, Bent 275

Pens N/A 500 Snowman Baby Bend, Bent Pen - red pen 2.00

Pens N/A 500 Spinner Ball NO BID

Pens N/A 500 Mop Top 4.00

Pens N/A 500 Pink pens w/ White imprint 1.50

Pens N/A 500 g/llzgtop Pens w/microfiber Cleaner & Stylus 205

Pens N/A 500 Autism Awareness mop top pens Light Blue NOBID

Pens N/A 500 Lime Green Mop Toppers 3.25

Scarves |N/A 52 Forest w/White 7.75

Short . , .

Sleeve s 100 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 14.90
Back

Polo

Short . .

Sleeve M 100 Vanous Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 14.90
Back

Polo

Short . o

Sleeve L 100 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 14.90
Back

Polo

Short . -

Sleeve XL 100 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 14.90
Back

Polo

Short . A .

Sleeve XXL 100 Vanous Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 16.35

- Back

Polo

Short : , -

Sleeve XXXL  |100 Vanous Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on -

| Back

Polo

Short K-2

Sleeve 60 Pee Wee League 3.50

Tee grade

Smart Stitch Inc.




Short
Sleeve  |ord-4th o, Elementary League 3.50
grade
Tee
Short
Sleeve |26t 144 Elementary League 3.50
grade
Tee
Short
Sleeve 7th-8th 60 Middle School 3.50
grade
Tee
Short , } | .
Sleeve Small 1000 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 8.95
Back - Crewneck
Tee
Short . , .
Sleeve Medium 1500 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 8.95
Back - Crewneck
Tee
Short . .
_ Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
Sleeve Large |2500 Back - Crewneck 8.95
Tee
Short . .
Sleeve XL 1500 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 8.95
Back - Crewneck
Tee
Short . . .
Sleeve XXL 1000 Vanous_Colors, Logo on Front, imprint on 10.50
Back - Crewneck
Tee
Shor Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
Sleeve XXXL |250 o ’ 11.99
Back - Crewneck
Tee
Short . .
Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
Sleeve XXXXL |250 Back - Crewneck 11.99
Tee
Short . : .
. Youth Various Colors, Logo on Front, imprint on
Sleeve . 250 » . , 9.49
Small Back - Crewneck
Tee
Short . , . .
Sleeve Y _ 250 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 0.49
Medium Back - Crewneck
Tee
Short . .
Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
?Leeeve Y Large |250 Back - Crewneck 9.49

Sinart Stitch Inc.




Short

Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Y XL 125 Back - Crewneck 9.49
Tee

Sweatshirt [Y, XS |20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red 10.25
Sweatshirt |Y, S 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red 10.25
Sweatshirt |Y, M 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red 10.25
Sweatshirt |Y, L 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red 10.25
Sweatshirt [Y, XL |20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red 10.25
Sweatshirt S 100  |Various Colors 9.49
Sweatshirt |M 100  |Various Colors 9.49
Sweatshirt |L 100 Various Colors 9.49
Sweatshirt | XL 100 Various Colors 9.49
Sweatshirt [ XXL 100 Various Colors 13.25
Basketball Y XS |100 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 11.90
Jersey Front or Back

Basketbali Y. S 100 VargqusColors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 11.90
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball Y, M 100 vVanous Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 11.90
Jersey | Front or Back

Basketball Y L 100 Varlous Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 11.90
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball Y. XL |00 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 11.90
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball small 100 Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 19,65
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball Medium |100 Var_:ous Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 12,65
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball Large  |100 Varlo»us Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 1965
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball XL 100 Vanous Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 1965
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball XXL 100 Va_nousI Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 1415
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball ,

Shorts Y, XS |100 Various Colors 6.35
Basketball ,

Shorts Y,S 100 Various Colors 6.35

Smart Stitch Inc.




Basketball Y, M 100 Various Colors 6.35
Shorts
Basketball Y,L 100 Various Colors 6.35
Shorts
Basketball .
Shorts Y, XL 100 Various Colors 6.35
Basketball Small 100 Various Colors 7.10
Shorts
Basketball . .
Shorts Medium |100 Various Colors 7.10
Basketball .
Shorts Large |100 Various Colors 7.10
Basketball XL 100 Various Colors 7.10
Shorts
Basketball . .
Shorts XXL 100 Various Colors 8.60
Toy N/A 500 6in Candy Cane Glow Sticks 4.75
Toy N/A 500 Christmas Tree Light Up Wand 10.00
Toy N/A 50 Mini Basketball with door backboard and net 27.75
Toy N/A 500 Sensory Pop Die 5.25
Wrist Band |N/A 2000 [Various Colors - Imprint 0.35
Zip Up . s

Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt
f{fﬂgies NIA 1800 e broidered - Various Golore 26.25

Smart Stitch Inc.

10



ITEM QTY Description PlIJQT(I:TE
Bags 16x12 | 1,000 | Various Colors with City Seal Z.25
Bags N/A 500 | Black Bags w/ Pink handles - with City Seal |3.2¢
Bags N/A 1,000 | Orange Frosted Pumpkin Bag with City Seal ||.8<
Bags 13"W X | 3,500 | Black Insulated Grocery Tote

15"H X

9 2.99
Bags N/A 1,000 | Holiday Tote |.AS
Bags N/A 125 | Recycled Convention Tote Bag

Charcoal 2.25

Bags N/A 500 | Stripe Canvas Tote Bags 9.2
Ball N/A 10 Full size basketballs printed with City Logo |4<.00
Ball 9" 150 | Basketball 2.1
Ball g" 150 | Soccer 2.1
Ball o" 150 | Baseball 218
Ball 9" 150 | Football 2aS
Bottles 20 0z 500 | Basecamp Tundra Bottle w/Screw top lid s$.9¢%
Bottles 20 oz 250 | Kelly Green w/ lid 2.4S
Botties 280z | 250 | Neon Orange 2.45
Bottles 200z 500 | Water Bottles White w/ Blue Top 1.2S
Bottles 30 oz 500 | Water Bottle Red w/ White 2.2S
Bracelet N/A 300 | Woven bracelet \.1¥
Candle N/A 300 | Tranquility Scented Candle - Apple 2.4
Cloth N/A 500 | Microfiber Cleaning cloth Green 0.4s
Decoration | N/A 500 | Nickel Snowflake Holiday Ornament 2.8%
Decoration | N/A 500 [ Christmas Tree Holiday Ornament 2.5
Fan N/A 500 | Folding Fan .95
Hats N/A 52 Forest w/ White \S.
Hats N/A 500 | Sun Visor 100
Hats N/A 1000 | Santa Hats 2.9%0




Hoodies S 16 Royal blue printed DTF on front

in White 24.00
Hoodies M 16 Royal blue printed DTF on front

in White 24.00
Hoodies L 15 Royal blue printed DTF on front

in White 24.00
Hoodies XL 10 Royal blue printed DTF on front

in White 24. 00
Hoodies XXL 5 Royal blue printed DTF on front

in White 280
Hoodies Youth |45 Neon Blue

Small IS.co

Hoodies Y,M 65 Neon Blue IS -00
Hoodies Y,L 40 Neon Blue IS.o0
Hoodies Y, XL 10 Neon Blue IS. 0
Keychain | N/A 300 | Bamboo Leatherette/Metal Round 4.3%9Q
Keychain | N/A 600 | Custom Nylon Keychain Strap 1.4$
Keyring N/A 500 | Super Plush 20
Lanyard N/A 150 | Royal Blue .45
Long S 250 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve IS.00
Tee
Long M 250 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve IS0
Tee
Long L 250 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve 5.00
Tee
Long XL 250 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve IS-cd
Tee
Long XXL 100 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve L.
Tee
Long Youth 100 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve Medium 1S.00

Tee




Long Y, L 100 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve }S-00
Tee
Long Y, XL 100 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve IS .00
Tee
Pens N/A 500 | Tree Christmas Multi-Color Inkbend Xtra,

Bent Pen 2.9)
Pens N/A 500 | Snowman Baby Bend, Bent Pen - red pen 2.4l
Pens N/A 500 | Spinner Ball i.3)
Pens N/A 500 | Mop Top 2.49
Pens N/A 500 | Pink pens w/ White imprint O.42
Pens N/A 500 | Moptop Pens w/microfiber Cleaner & Stylus

Blue 2.43
Pens N/A 500 | Autism Awareness mop top pens Light Blue |2.4%
Pens N/A 500 |Lime Green Mop Toppers 2.49
Scarves N/A 52 Forest w/White 1¢4.S0
Short S 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
Sleeve Back 400
Polo
Short M 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
Sleeve Back I<.CO
Polo
Short L 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
Sleeve Back [¢.00
Polo
Short XL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
Sieeve Back 4.0
Polo
Short XXL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
Sleeve Back [S .00
Polo
Short XXXL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on
Sleeve Back .00
Polo
Short K-2 60 Pee Wee League
Sleeve grade O-S0

Tee




 Short 3rd-4th [60 | Elementary League

Sleeve grade 10.90
Tee

Short 5th-6th |60 Elementary League

Sleeve grade [0.5P
Tee

Short 7th-8th | 60 Middle School

Sleeve grade f\- S0
Tee

Short Small 1000 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck 8.0
Tee

Short Medium | 1500 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck 8.2%
Tee

Short Large | 2500 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck 3.0
Tee

Short XL 1500 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck 8.2
Tee

Short XXL 1000 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck 9 S0
Tee

Short XXXL 250 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck Iy.S0
Tee

Short XXXXL | 250 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck (R.00
Tee

Short Youth | 250 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Small Back - Crewneck W2
Tee

Short Y 250 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Medium Back - Crewneck W28
Tee

Short Y Large | 2560 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck W2
Tee

Short Y XL 125 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on |2. 0




Sleeve Back - Crewneck

Tee

Sweatshirt | Y, XS 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red L .28
Sweatshirt | Y, S 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red .28
Sweatshirt | Y, M 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red .25
Sweatshirt | Y, L 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red 0-2%
Sweatshirt | Y, XL 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red 6. 25
Sweatshirt | S 100 | Various Colors 4.2
Sweatshirt | M 100 | Various Colors (4.26
Sweatshirt | L 100 | Various Colors 4. 2S
Sweatshirt | XL 100 | Various Colors l¢.2C
Sweatshirt | XXL 100 | Various Colors (S.2§
Basketball | Y, XS 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Jersey Front or Back (F-25
Basketball | Y, S 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 13 .25
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball | Y, M 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on \3.28
Jersey Front or Back '
Basketball | Y, L 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 1325
Jersey Front or Back )
Basketball | Y, XL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on (1.2
Jersey Front or Back '
Basketball | Small 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 1R.00
Jersey Front or Back :
Basketball | Medium | 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Jersey Front or Back 18.c0
Basketball | Large 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 18. 00
Jersey Front or Back ’
Basketball | XL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 18. 00
Jersey Front or Back ’
Basketball | XXL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on 1a-00
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball | Y, XS |100 | Various Colors 12.00
Shorts

Basketball | Y, S 100 | Various Colors 12..CO

Shorts




Basketball | Y, M 100 | Various Colors

Shorts \2-00
Basketball |Y, L 100 | Various Colors

Shorts \2.60
Basketball |Y, XL 100 | Various Colors

Shorts 12-00
Basketball | Small 100 | Various Colors

Jersey %00
Basketball | Medium | 100 | Various Colors

Jersey \4-co
Basketball | Large 100 | Various Colors

Jersey \4-00
Basketball | XL 100 | Various Colors oo
Jersey

Basketball | XXL 100 | Various Colors

Jersey \S.c0
Toy N/A 500 | 6in Candy Cane Glow Sticks 1.AS
Toy N/A 500 | Christmas Tree Light Up Wand 4.0<
Toy N/A 50 Mini Basketball with door backboard and net g.00
Toy N/A 500 | Sensory Pop Die \.2S
\é\g:ls; N/A 2000 | Various Colors - Imprint O.US
Zip Up N/A 500 | Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt

Staff Embroidered - Various Colors 24.00

Hoodies




Guand fowsae Jhaphoes LAL

. UNIT | EXT.
ITEM QTyY Description PRICE | PRICE
Bags 16x12 | 1,000 | Various Colors with City Seal $1.12ea | $1120
Bags N/A 500 | Black Bags w/ Pink handles - with City Seal | $5.75ea | $2875
Bags N/A 1,000 | Orange Frosted Pumpkin Bag with City Seal | $1.65ea | $1650
Bags 13"W X | 3,500 | Black Insulated Grocery Tote
15"H X .
9 $5.85ea |$20,475
Bags N/A 1,000 | Holiday Tote $2.82ea | $2820
Bags N/A 125 | Recycled Convention Tote Bag
Charcoal $6.00ea | $750
Bags N/A 500 | Stripe Canvas Tote Bags $6.85a | $3425
Ball N/A 10 Full size basketballs printed with City Logo $25 $250
Ball 9" 150 | Basketball $30.30 | $4545
Ball 9" 150 | Soccer $16.32 | $2448
Ball 9" 150 | Baseball $6.26 | $939
Ball 9" 150 | Football $15.26 | $2289
Bottles 20 oz 500 | Basecamp Tundra Bottle w/Screw top lid $18.25ea| $9125
Bottles 20 oz 250 | Kelly Green w/ lid $2.29¢a |$572.50
Bottles 28 oz 250 | Neon Orange $4.15ea |$1037.50
Bottles 20 oz 500 | Water Bottles White w/ Blue Top $2.29ea | $1145
Bottles 30 oz 500 | Water Bottle Red w/ White 34 05ea | $2025
Bracelet N/A 300 | Woven bracelet $3.4%¢a | $1026
Candle N/A 300 | Tranquility Scented Candle - Apple $5.58¢ea | $1674
Cloth N/A 500 | Microfiber Cleaning cloth Green $3.15ea | $1575
Decoration | N/A 500 | Nickel Snowflake Holiday Ornament $3.84ea | $1920
Decoration | N/A 500 | Christmas Tree Holiday Ornament $4.75ea | $2375
Fan N/A 500 | Folding Fan $2.40ea | $1200
Hats N/A 52 Forest w/ White $10.50ea| $546
Hats N/A 500 | Sun Visor $5.40ea | $2700
Hats N/A 1000 | Santa Hats $4.14ea | $4140




Hoodies S 15 Royal blue printed DTF on front

in White $21ea | $315
Hoodies M 15 Royal blue printed DTF on front

in White $21ea | $315
Hoodies L 15 _Royal_blue printed DTF on front $21ea | $315

in White
Hoodies XL 10 Royal blue printed DTF on front

in White $21ea | $210
Hoodies XXL 5 Royal blue printed DTF on front

in White $21ea | $105
Hoodies Youth |45 Neon Blue $21ea | $945

Small

Hoodies Y, M 65 Neon Blue $21ea | $1365
Hoodies Y,L 40 Neon Blue $21ea | $840
Hoodies Y, XL 10 Neon Blue $21ea | $210
Keychain | N/A 300 | Bamboo Leatherette/Metal Round $5.89ea | $1767
Keychain | N/A 600 | Custom Nylon Keychain Strap $1.30ea | $780
Keyring N/A 500 | Super Plush $2.16ea | $1080
Lanyard N/A 150 | Royal Blue $2.54ea | $381
Long S 250 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve $11ea |[$2750
Tee
Long M 250 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve $11ea | $2750
Tee
Long L 250 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve $11ea | $2750
Tee
Long XL 250 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve $11ea | $2750
Tee
Long XXL 100 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve $13.50ea | $1350
Tee
Long Youth 100 | Various Colors with City Seal
Sleeve Medium $11ea | $1100

Tee




Long Y, L 100 | Various Colors with City Seal

Sleeve $11ea | $1100
Tee

Long Y, XL 100 | Various Colors with City Seal

Sleeve $11ea | $1100
Tee

Pens N/A 500 'El;reenti gggstmas Multi-Color Inkbend Xtra, $3.54ea | $1770
Pens N/A 500 | Snowman Baby Bend, Bent Pen - red pen $2.82ea |$1410
Pens N/A 500 | Spinner Ball $3.27ea |$1635
Pens N/A 500 | Mop Top $3.27ea |$1635
Pens N/A 500 | Pink pens w/ White imprint $.97ea | $485

Pens N/A 500 gllzgtop Pens w/microfiber Cleaner & Stylus $3.27¢a |$1635
Pens N/A 500 | Autism Awareness mop top pens Light Blue | $3.27ea [$1635
Pens N/A 500 | Lime Green Mop Toppers $3.27ea [$1635
Scarves N/A 52 Forest w/White $12.00ea| $624
Short S 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back $17.00ea | $1700
Polo

Short M 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back $17.00ea | $1700
Polo

Short L 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back $17.00ea | $1700
Polo

Short XL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back $17.00ea | $1700
Polo

Short XXL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back $19.00ea | $1900
Polo

Short XXXL |[100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back $20.00ea| $2000
Polo

Short K-2 60 Pee Wee League

Sleeve grade $10.50ea | $630

Tee




Short 3rd-4th | 60 Elementary League

Sleeve grade $10.50ea | $630
Tee

Short 5th-6th | 60 Elementary League

Sleeve grade $10.50ea | $630
Tee

Short 7th-8th | 60 Middle School

Sleeve grade $10.50ea | $630
Tee

Short Small 1000 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck $8ea |$8000
Tee

Short Medium | 1500 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck $8ea  1$12,000
Tee

Short Large |2500 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck $8ea  |$20,000
Tee

Short XL 1500 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck $8ea $12,000
Tee

Short XXL 1000 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck $10.50ea [$10,500
Tee

Short XXXL | 250 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck $11.50ea | $2875
Tee

Short XXXXL | 250 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck $12ea |$3000
Tee

Short Youth | 250 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Small Back - Crewneck $8ea [$2000
Tee

Short Y 250 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Medium Back - Crewneck $8ea |$2000
Tee

Short Y Large | 250 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Sleeve Back - Crewneck $8ea [$2000
Tee

Short Y XL 125 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on $8ea | $1000




Sleeve Back - Crewneck

Tee

Sweatshirt | Y, XS |20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red $16ea | $320
Sweatshirt | Y, S 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red $16ea | $320
Sweatshirt | Y, M 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red $16ea | $320
Sweatshirt | Y, L 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red $16ea | $320
Sweatshirt | Y, XL 20 Crewneck Sweatshirt Red

Sweatshirt | S 100 | Various Colors $16ea |$1600
Sweatshirt | M 100 | Various Colors $16ea [$1600
Sweatshirt | L. 100 [ Various Colors $16ea |$1600
Sweatshirt | XL 100 | Various Colors $16ea |$1600
Sweatshirt | XXL 100 | Various Colors $18ea |$1800
Basketball | Y, XS | 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Jersey Front or Back $10.50ea 131050
Basketball |Y, S 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on $10.50ea |$1050
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball | Y, M 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on $10.50ea ($1050
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball | Y, L 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Jersey Front or Back $10.50ea|$1050
Basketball |Y, XL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on $10.50ea |$1050
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball | Small 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on $10.50ea |$1050
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball | Medium | 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on $10.50ea |$1050
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball | Large 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on

Jersey Front or Back $10.50ea [$1050
Basketball | XL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on $10.50ea |$1050
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball | XXL 100 | Various Colors, Logo on Front, Imprint on $13ea 51300
Jersey Front or Back

Basketball | Y, XS 100 | Various Colors $9.50ea | $950

Shorts

Basketball | Y, S 100 | Various Colors $9.50ea | $950

Shorts




Basketball | Y, M 100 | Various Colors $9.50ea | $950

Shorts

Basketball | Y, L 100 | Various Colors $9.50ea | $950

Shorts

Basketball | Y, XL 100 | Various Colors $9.50ea | $950

Shorts

Basketball | Small 100 | Various Colors $10.50ea |$1050
Jersey

Basketball | Medium [ 100 | Various Colors $10.50ea [$1050
Jersey

Basketball | Large | 100 | Various Colors $10.50ea [$1050
Jersey

Basketball | XL 100 | Various Colors $10.50ea [$1050

Jersey 4

Basketball | XXL 100 | Various Colors $13.50ea |$1350
Jersey

Toy N/A 500 | 6in Candy Cane Glow Sticks $1.87ea | $935

Toy N/A 500 | Christmas Tree Light Up Wand $6.18ea [$3090
Toy N/A 50 Mini Basketball with door backboard and net | $14.ea | $700

Toy N/A 500 | Sensory Pop Die $3.54ea |$1770
\é\;rLsc'; N/A 2000 | Various Colors - Imprint $1.25¢a [$2500
Zip Up N/A 500 | Fleece Fuli-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt

Staff Embroidered - Various Colors $34.ea |$17,000
Hoodies

Bid Total $256,509.00
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