

BID2025-54 FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF UNIFORMS FOR TRENTON POLICE FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR WITH AN OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR - VIRTUAL BID OPENING DATE MAY 16, 2025			
NUMBER OF BIDS SUBMITTED	3	FATAL FLAW	
NAME OF PROPOSER	ACTION UNIFORM CO. LLC	UNIFORM WAREHOUSE, INC	GALLS, LLC
ADDRESS	1500 S NEW ROAD	20701 NORDHOFF STREET, CHATSWORTH, CA, 91311	1340 RUSSELL CAVE ROAD
CITY, STATE, ZIP	PLEASANT VILLE , NJ 08232	1000 N 10TH STREET, MILVILLE, NJ 08332	LEXINGTON, KY 40505
CONTACT NAME	RICK ZELIG	AMEER NOUH	MIKE FADDEN
TELEPHONE	609 646 1522	818 341 1500X4027	844 464 2577
FAX	605 568 5064	818 341 9900	N/A
E-MAIL	RICK@ACTIONUNIFORMCO.COM	BIDS@UNIFORMW.COM	BIDREVIEW@GALLS.COM
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
PROHIBITED INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA #1 ISSUED 5-2-2025 MANDATORY	INCLUDED	DID NOT SUBMIT	INCLUDED
REQUIRED EVIDENCE AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATIONS QUESTIONNAIRE - MANDATORY	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT - MANDATORY	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT OF 1990 LANGUAGE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE FOR CONTRACTOR	INCLUDED	REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD	INCLUDED
CERTIFICATE OF EMPLOYEE INFORMATION (EIC)	CERT# 50245 EXP 03/15/2027	REQUIRED FROM AWARDED PROPOSER WITH SIGNED CONTRACTS	CERT# 48619 EXP 03/15/2027
REQUIRED EVIDENCE AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATIONS QUESTIONNAIRE - MANDATORY	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY EXHIBIT A	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
STATE & FEDERAL DEBARMENT CERTIFICATIONS	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
ETHICS COMPLAINT DISCLOSURE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE	REQUIRED FROM AWARDED PROPOSER WITH SIGNED CONTRACTS	REQUIRED FROM AWARDED PROPOSER WITH SIGNED CONTRACTS	REQUIRED FROM AWARDED PROPOSER WITH SIGNED CONTRACTS
CITY OF TRENTON RESIDENT EMPLOYMENT POLICY	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
SEE ATTACHED UNIT PRICES PER EACH ITEM FOR YEAR ONE (1)	SEE ATTACHED PRICES	SEE ATTACHED PRICES	SEE ATTACHED PRICES
OPTION TO EXTEND THE SERVICES FOR AN ADDITIONAL ONE (1) YEAR	AWARDED PROPOSER MUST AGREE TO EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND FOR AN ADDITIONAL YEAR (2026)	AWARDED PROPOSER MUST AGREE TO EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND FOR AN ADDITIONAL YEAR (2026)	SEE ATTACHED PRICES
60-DAY EXTENSION COMPLIANCE	YES	YES	YES
COMPLIANCE WITH EMERGENCY SERVICES	YES	YES	NO
EXCEPTIONS	YES	YES	NONE
THREE (3) REFERENCES	INCLUDED	NO	NO
FATAL FLAW	NONE	YES- DID NOT SUBMIT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDUM #1 WITH THE BID AT THE TIME OF OPENING	NONE

Action
Uniform

THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE AWARDED FOR A PERIOD OF
ONE (1) YEAR WITH AN OPTION
TO EXTEND ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR

	Unit Price per item	Unit Price (S-XL)	Unit Price 2X	Unit Price Size 3X or Larger
Baseball Hat	15.00	15.00	15.00	15.00
BDU Trouser	85.00	85.00	85.00	85.00
Cross Strap	48.00	48.00	48.00	48.00
Wool Trouser	139.00	139.00	139.00	139.00
Dress Bouse	675.00	675.00	675.00	675.00
Dress Hat	70.00	70.00	70.00	70.00
D-Rings	18.00	18.00	18.00	18.00
Female Long Sleeves	69.00	69.00	69.00	69.00
Female Short Sleeves	67.00	67.00	67.00	67.00
Female Trouser	75.00	75.00	75.00	75.00
Short Sleeve Polo	70.00	70.00	70.00	75.00
Long Sleeve Polo	72.00	72.00	72.00	77.00
Male Long Sleeve	69.00	69.00	69.00	69.00
Male Short Sleeve	67.00	67.00	67.00	67.00
Male Trouser	75.00	75.00	75.00	75.00
Name Plate	15.00	15.00	15.00	15.00
Rain Cap Cover	9.00	9.00	9.00	9.00
Rain Coat	245.00	245.00	245.00	245.00
Sam Browne Belt	70.00	70.00	70.00	70.00
Tie	10.00	10.00	10.00	16.00
Turtleneck	38.00	38.00	38.00	38.00
Trooper Hat	22.00	22.00	22.00	22.00
Whistle	1.50	1.50	1.50	1.50
Wind Breaker	159.00	159.00	159.00	159.00
Winter Coat	196.00	196.00	196.00	196.00
Winter Coat Liner	139.00	139.00	139.00	139.00

PROPOSERS SHALL SUBMIT AN ADDITIONAL PROPOSAL PAGE FOR THE OPTION TO EXTEND ONE
YEAR CONTRACT - SAME ITEMS

*Uniform
Warehouse
Sales.*

46

THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE AWARDED FOR A PERIOD OF
ONE (1) YEAR WITH AN OPTION
TO EXTEND ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR

	Unit Price per item	Unit Price (S-XL)	Unit Price 2X	Unit Price Size 3X or Larger
Baseball Hat	\$15.90	\$15.90	\$15.90	\$15.90
BDU Trouser	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20
Cross Strap	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20
Wool Trouser	\$101.90	\$101.90	\$101.90	\$101.90
Dress Bouse	\$275	\$275	\$275	\$275
Dress Hat	\$71.50	\$71.50	\$71.50	\$71.50
D-Rings	\$23.90	\$23.90	\$23.90	\$23.90
Female Long Sleeves	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20
Female Short Sleeves	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20
Female Trouser	\$55.90	\$55.90	\$55.90	\$55.90
Short Sleeve Polo	\$40.50	\$40.50	\$40.50	\$40.50
Long Sleeve Polo	\$45.90	\$45.90	\$45.90	\$45.90
Male Long Sleeve	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20
Male Short Sleeve	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20	\$66.20
Male Trouser	\$55.90	\$55.90	\$55.90	\$55.90
Name Plate	\$11.90	\$11.90	\$11.90	\$11.90
Rain Cap Cover	\$10.90	\$10.90	\$10.90	\$10.90
Rain Coat	\$142.90	\$142.90	\$142.90	\$142.90
Sam Browne Belt	\$55.90	\$55.90	\$55.90	\$55.90
Tie	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00
Turtleneck	\$38.25	\$38.25	\$38.25	\$38.25
Trooper Hat	\$19.90	\$19.90	\$19.90	\$19.90
Whistle	\$5.90	\$5.90	\$5.90	\$5.90
Wind Breaker	\$152.90	\$152.90	\$152.90	\$152.90
Winter Coat	\$183.90	\$183.90	\$183.90	\$183.90
Winter Coat Liner	\$71.50	\$71.50	\$71.50	\$71.50

PROPOSERS SHALL SUBMIT AN ADDITIONAL PROPOSAL PAGE FOR THE OPTION TO EXTEND ONE
YEAR CONTRACT - SAME ITEMS

**EXCEPTIONS
(IF NONE, PLEASE NOTE)**

We are offering our own brand — please see the product sheet for a detailed description.

The following exceptions are outlined below:

COURTLAND BOOT JACK CO. is no longer in business; therefore, equivalent substitutes in both quality and function have been provided.

Uniform shirts are made from a Poly-Wool Lycra blend, offering breathability and stretch for enhanced comfort and flexibility.

Male and female trousers are made from a Poly-Rayon Lycra blend instead of polyester. This material offers similar functionality with enhanced quality.

Our Duty Jackets and Parkas share a similar design and functionality, and are built to an excellent standard of quality.

Samples are available upon request at bids@uniformw.com.

THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE AWARDED FOR A PERIOD OF
ONE (1) YEAR WITH AN OPTION
TO EXTEND ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR

	Unit Price per item	Unit Price (S-XL)	Unit Price 2X	Unit Price Size 3X or Larger
1) Baseball Hat	\$16.99			
2) BDU Trouser	\$90.00			
3) Cross Strap	\$41.56			
4) Wool Trouser	\$125.00			
5) Dress Bouse	\$700.00			
6) Dress Hat	\$85.00			
7) D-Rings	\$12.50			
8) Female Long Sleeves	\$76.84			
9) Female Short Sleeves	\$63.48			
10) Female Trouser	\$70.95			
11) Short Sleeve Polo	\$69.72			
12) Long Sleeve Polo	\$71.61			
13) Male Long Sleeve	\$77.99			
14) Male Short Sleeve	\$63.48			
15) Male Trouser	\$61.95			
16) Name Plate	\$20.00			
17) Rain Cap Cover	\$16.99			
18) Rain Coat	\$344.99			
19) Sam Browne Belt	\$50.00			
20) Tie	\$5.00			
21) Turtleneck	\$45.48			
22) Trooper Hat	NO BID			
23) Whistle	\$1.40			
24) Wind Breaker	\$220.27			
25) Winter Coat	\$145.08			
26) Winter Coat Liner	\$232.03			

PROPOSERS SHALL SUBMIT AN ADDITIONAL PROPOSAL PAGE FOR THE OPTION TO EXTEND ONE
YEAR CONTRACT - SAME ITEMS

YEAR 1 RENEWAL PRICES ON NEXT PAGE

GALLS, LLC Trenton NJ BID 2025-54 Pricing Year 1 and Renewal Year 1

LINE NUMBER	Trenton Line Description	STYLE #	ITEM DESCRIPTION W ALL VAS	VENDOR ITEM #	VENDOR NAME	NET PRICE Year 1	NET PRICE Renewal Year 1
1	Baseball Hat	HW682	FLEXFIT PERFORMANCE CAP	6590 BLK L/XL	S & S Activewear		
2	BDU Trouser	TR2735	MENS NJ STATE POLICE PANTS W/GOLD STRIPE	6827 4 32 30	BLAUER MFG CO	\$16.99	\$17.84
3	Cross Strap	LR857	1 1/4 SHOULDER STRAP - UNLINED	1435PL NKL 48/50	PERFECT FIT	\$90.00	\$94.50
4	Wool Trouser	TR1399	7-POCKET WOOL BLEND TROUSERS w/REAR HIP POCKETS HAVE POINTED POCKET FLAP INSERTED INTO TOP WELT	8561P7T-5 4 32 30	Blauer Mfg Co	\$41.56	\$43.64
5	Dress Blouse	JX1009	TRENTON POLICE DEPT J400C DRESS BLOUSE 55/45 PW 13.5 OZ W/SIL NJ BUTTONS	TRENTON PD NAV CST	Hope Uniform & Security	\$125.00	\$131.25
6	Dress Hat	HW1945	PERSHING SERGE 400 VIS BLK STRAP DULL OVERHEAD W/BUCKLE& NJ BTNS FINISH CHOICE	R-801 NAV 658 SIL	Keystone Uniform Cap Corp	\$700.00	\$735.00
7	D-Rings	LR846	SHOULDER STRAP SLIDING D RING (PAIR)	S4428-PLAIN-SLVR	PERFECT FIT	\$85.00	\$89.25
8	Female Long Sleeves	SH3371	WOMENS L/S NJ CORRECTIONS POLYESTER/RAYON UNIFORM SHIRT	V7296 34	Lion First Responder/ Elbeco	\$12.50	\$13.13
9	Female Short Sleeves	SH3373	WOMENS S/S NJ CORRECTIONS POLYESTER/RAYON UNIFORM SHIRT	V7307 34	Lion First Responder/ Elbeco	\$76.84	\$80.88
10	Female Trouser	TR2131	NEW JERSEY SPECIAL POLY 6 POCKET WOMENS PANT	V7307 34	Lion First Responder/ Elbeco	\$83.48	\$86.65
11	Short Sleeve Polo	SW672	UFJ TACT KNT S/S SHIRT	E8930LC 10 OB	Lion First Responder/ Elbeco	\$70.95	\$74.50
12	Long Sleeve Polo	SR585	UFJ TACTICAL L/S KNT SHIRT	K5134-L-T	Lion First Responder/ Elbeco	\$69.72	\$73.21
13	Male Long Sleeve	SH3370	MENS L/S NJ CORRECTIONS POLYESTER/RAYON UNIFORM SHIRT	K5144-L-T	Lion First Responder/ Elbeco	\$71.61	\$75.19
14	Male Short Sleeve	SH3372	MENS S/S NJ CORRECTIONS POLYESTER/RAYON UNIFORM SHIRT	V7295 14.5 33	Lion First Responder/ Elbeco	\$77.99	\$81.89
15	Male Trouser	ZR125	MENS TOP AUTHORITY PLUS TROUSERS	V7305 14.5	Lion First Responder/ Elbeco	\$63.48	\$66.65
16	Name Plate	ZA1608	A4180 CUSTOM NAMEBAR	E8950RN 30 OB	Lion First Responder/ Elbeco	\$81.95	\$85.05
17	Rain Cap Cover	HA048	GORE-TEX REVERSIBLE HAT COVER, BLACK/FLUORESCENT YELLOW	A4180 GP	V H BLACKINTON IDS ETC	\$20.00	\$21.00
18	Rain Coat	RW9790	REVERSIBLE LONG RAIN JACKET	9101 53 UNIV 30	Blauer Mfg Co	\$16.99	\$17.84
19	Sam Browne Belt	LP1159	2 1/4 SAM BROWNE WAIST BELT	9790 53 L 45	Blauer Mfg Co	\$344.99	\$362.24
20	Tie	UA494	3IN POLYESTER CLIP ON TIE W/ BUTTONHOLE	204A 34 SIL	PERFECT FIT	\$50.00	\$52.50
21	Turtleneck	ST468	BLAUER STREETGEAR TURTLENECK	90010 061 18 IN	SAMUEL BROOME UNIFORM ACCESSOR	\$5.00	\$5.25
22	Trouser Hat		NO BID	8100X 4 L 30	Blauer Mfg Co	\$45.58	\$47.86
23	Whistles	UA699	PLASTIC POLICE WHISTLE	PWBS-1	Hamburger Woolen Co Inc	NO BID	NO BID
24	Wind Breaker	JC591	BLAUER B-DRY 3-SEASON DUTY JACKET W/OUT PILE COLLAR STD SILVER P BUTTONS	6120 11 M 30	Blauer Mfg Co	\$1.40	\$1.47
25	Winter Coat	JA167	SPIEWAK PERFORMANCE SOFT JACKET W/ SIDE VENT ZIPPERS	S318Z 003 MD REG	I Spiewak	\$220.27	\$231.28
26	Winter Coat Liner	JA000	WEATHERTECH SYSTEMS AIRFLOW DUTY JACKET	SH3468 003 M REG	I Spiewak	\$145.08	\$152.33
						\$232.03	\$243.63